

EXHIBIT B

Timekeeper	Work Date	Hours	Task
Anthony M. Stiegler	2/10/2013	0.3	Fact and Legal Investigation and Drafting of
Anthony M. Stiegler	2/11/2013	0.7	Fact and Legal Investigation and Drafting of Complaint/Amended Complaint
Anthony M. Stiegler	2/13/2013	1	Fact and Legal Investigation and Drafting of Complaint/Amended Complaint
Anthony M. Stiegler	2/22/2013	0.7	Case Administration (includes co-counsel conferences not otherwise classified)
Anthony M. Stiegler	2/25/2013	0.3	Fact and Legal Investigation and Drafting of Complaint/Amended Complaint
Anthony M. Stiegler	3/7/2013	0.8	Fact and Legal Investigation and Drafting of Complaint/Amended Complaint
Anthony M. Stiegler	3/14/2013	0.5	Fact and Legal Investigation and Drafting of Complaint/Amended Complaint
Anthony M. Stiegler	3/27/2013	0.6	Fact and Legal Investigation and Drafting of Complaint/Amended Complaint
Anthony M. Stiegler	3/28/2013	0.3	Fact and Legal Investigation and Drafting of Complaint/Amended Complaint
Anthony M. Stiegler	4/7/2013	0.9	Case Administration (includes co-counsel conferences not otherwise classified)
Anthony M. Stiegler	4/12/2013	0.5	Fact and Legal Investigation and Drafting of Complaint/Amended Complaint
Anthony M. Stiegler	4/20/2013	0.5	Fact and Legal Investigation and Drafting of Complaint/Amended Complaint
Anthony M. Stiegler	4/20/2013	0.3	Fact and Legal Investigation and Drafting of Complaint/Amended Complaint
Anthony M. Stiegler	4/22/2013	0.2	Fact and Legal Investigation and Drafting of Complaint/Amended Complaint
Anthony M. Stiegler	4/23/2013	0.5	Case Administration (includes co-counsel conferences not otherwise classified)
Anthony M. Stiegler	5/14/2013	0.5	Case Administration (includes co-counsel conferences not otherwise classified)
Anthony M. Stiegler	5/20/2013	2.7	Case Administration (includes co-counsel conferences not otherwise classified)
Anthony M. Stiegler	5/24/2013	1.3	Fact and Legal Investigation and Drafting of Complaint/Amended Complaint
Anthony M. Stiegler	6/3/2013	1.7	Fact and Legal Investigation and Drafting of Complaint/Amended Complaint
Anthony M. Stiegler	6/4/2013	1.2	Fact and Legal Investigation and Drafting of Complaint/Amended Complaint
Anthony M. Stiegler	6/5/2013	0.7	Fact and Legal Investigation and Drafting of Complaint/Amended Complaint
Anthony M. Stiegler	6/6/2013	0.3	Fact and Legal Investigation and Drafting of Complaint/Amended Complaint
Anthony M. Stiegler	6/12/2013	1.6	Locate and Communciate with Potential Class Members

Timekeeper	Work Date	Hours	Task
Anthony M. Stiegler	6/13/2013	0.5	Case Administration (includes co-counsel conferences not otherwise classified)
Anthony M. Stiegler	6/14/2013	0.5	Case Administration (includes co-counsel conferences not otherwise classified)
Anthony M. Stiegler	6/17/2013	0.5	Case Administration (includes co-counsel conferences not otherwise classified)
Anthony M. Stiegler	6/20/2013	0.7	Case Administration (includes co-counsel conferences not otherwise classified)
Anthony M. Stiegler	6/24/2013	0.2	Opposing Defendants' Motion to Transfer Venue (other than Court hearing)
Anthony M. Stiegler	6/25/2013	1.2	Case Administration (includes co-counsel conferences not otherwise classified)
Anthony M. Stiegler	6/26/2013	0.2	Case Administration (includes co-counsel conferences not otherwise classified)
Anthony M. Stiegler	7/1/2013	0.3	Case Administration (includes co-counsel conferences not otherwise classified)
Anthony M. Stiegler	7/2/2013	0.7	Case Administration (includes co-counsel conferences not otherwise classified)
Anthony M. Stiegler	7/9/2013	1.8	Case Administration (includes co-counsel conferences not otherwise classified)
Anthony M. Stiegler	8/4/2013	0.6	Case Administration (includes co-counsel conferences not otherwise classified)
Anthony M. Stiegler	8/20/2013	0.3	Case Administration (includes co-counsel conferences not otherwise classified)
Anthony M. Stiegler	8/21/2013	0.6	Case Administration (includes co-counsel conferences not otherwise classified)
Anthony M. Stiegler	8/22/2013	0.3	Case Administration (includes co-counsel conferences not otherwise classified)
Anthony M. Stiegler	8/24/2013	2.3	Case Administration (includes co-counsel conferences not otherwise classified)
Anthony M. Stiegler	8/26/2013	1.3	Rule 26(f) Conference and Report to Court; Opposing Defendants' Motion to Transfer Venue (other than Court hearing)
Anthony M. Stiegler	8/27/2013	1.1	Rule 26(f) Conference and Report to Court; Opposing Defendants' Motion to Transfer Venue (other than Court hearing)
Anthony M. Stiegler	8/28/2013	1.3	Case Administration (includes co-counsel conferences not otherwise classified)
Anthony M. Stiegler	8/29/2013	0.8	Case Administration (includes co-counsel conferences not otherwise classified)
Anthony M. Stiegler	9/3/2013	0.5	Rule 26(f) Conference and Report to Court
Anthony M. Stiegler	9/4/2013	0.2	Case Administration (includes co-counsel conferences not otherwise classified)

Timekeeper	Work Date	Hours	Task
Anthony M. Stiegler	9/5/2013	1.3	Case Administration (includes co-counsel conferences not otherwise classified)
Anthony M. Stiegler	9/6/2013	0.5	Collect, Review and Produce Documents Requested by Defendants
Anthony M. Stiegler	9/12/2013	0.7	Case Administration (includes co-counsel conferences not otherwise classified)
Anthony M. Stiegler	9/13/2013	0.1	Case Administration (includes co-counsel conferences not otherwise classified)
Anthony M. Stiegler	9/13/2013	1	Case Administration (includes co-counsel conferences not otherwise classified)
Anthony M. Stiegler	9/16/2013	0.3	Rule 26(f) Conference and Report to Court
Anthony M. Stiegler	9/18/2013	1.5	Rule 26(f) Conference and Report to Court
Anthony M. Stiegler	9/21/2013	0.3	Other Discovery (initial disclosures, third party discovery, etc.); Rule 26(f) Conference and Report to Court; Hearing on Motion to Transfer Venue and Rule 16(b) Status Conference
Anthony M. Stiegler	9/22/2013	0.5	Rule 26(f) Conference and Report to Court
Anthony M. Stiegler	9/23/2013	0.9	Case Administration (includes co-counsel conferences not otherwise classified)
Anthony M. Stiegler	9/25/2013	0.4	Case Administration (includes co-counsel conferences not otherwise classified)
Anthony M. Stiegler	9/30/2013	0.3	Case Administration (includes co-counsel conferences not otherwise classified)
Anthony M. Stiegler	10/5/2013	0.7	Case Administration (includes co-counsel conferences not otherwise classified)
Anthony M. Stiegler	10/8/2013	0.6	Case Administration (includes co-counsel conferences not otherwise classified)
Anthony M. Stiegler	10/17/2013	0.3	Case Administration (includes co-counsel conferences not otherwise classified)
Anthony M. Stiegler	10/24/2013	0.4	Case Administration (includes co-counsel conferences not otherwise classified)
Anthony M. Stiegler	10/26/2013	0.8	Case Administration (includes co-counsel conferences not otherwise classified)
Anthony M. Stiegler	10/28/2013	0.5	Plaintiffs' Motion for Preliminary Injunction (other than Court hearing)
Anthony M. Stiegler	10/29/2013	0.3	Case Administration (includes co-counsel conferences not otherwise classified)
Anthony M. Stiegler	10/31/2013	0.3	Case Administration (includes co-counsel conferences not otherwise classified)
Anthony M. Stiegler	11/1/2013	0.1	Case Administration (includes co-counsel conferences not otherwise classified)

Timekeeper	Work Date	Hours	Task
Anthony M. Stiegler	11/3/2013	1.2	Case Administration (includes co-counsel conferences not otherwise classified)
Anthony M. Stiegler	11/4/2013	0.4	Plaintiffs' Motion for Preliminary Injunction (other than Court hearing)
Anthony M. Stiegler	11/5/2013	3.3	Plaintiffs' Motion for Preliminary Injunction (other than Court hearing)
Anthony M. Stiegler	11/6/2013	0.7	Plaintiffs' Motion for Preliminary Injunction (other than Court hearing)
Anthony M. Stiegler	11/7/2013	0.5	Case Administration (includes co-counsel conferences not otherwise classified)
Anthony M. Stiegler	11/9/2013	0.5	Case Administration (includes co-counsel conferences not otherwise classified)
Anthony M. Stiegler	11/11/2013	0.1	Case Administration (includes co-counsel conferences not otherwise classified)
Anthony M. Stiegler	11/12/2013	0.1	Opposing Defendants' Motion(s) to Dismiss (other than Court hearing)
Anthony M. Stiegler	11/20/2013	0.3	Case Administration (includes co-counsel conferences not otherwise classified)
Anthony M. Stiegler	11/22/2013	0.5	Plaintiffs' Motion for Preliminary Injunction (other than Court hearing)
Anthony M. Stiegler	11/25/2013	0.3	Plaintiffs' Motion for Preliminary Injunction (other than Court hearing)
Anthony M. Stiegler	12/1/2013	0.4	Case Administration (includes co-counsel conferences not otherwise classified)
Anthony M. Stiegler	12/2/2013	0.2	Plaintiffs' Motion for Preliminary Injunction (other than Court hearing)
Anthony M. Stiegler	12/5/2013	0.3	Plaintiffs' Motion for Preliminary Injunction (other than Court hearing)
Anthony M. Stiegler	12/6/2013	0.3	Rule 26(f) Conference and Report to Court
Anthony M. Stiegler	12/9/2013	0.2	Plaintiffs' Motion for Preliminary Injunction (other than Court hearing)
Anthony M. Stiegler	12/10/2013	1.3	Plaintiffs' Motion for Preliminary Injunction (other than Court hearing)
Anthony M. Stiegler	12/11/2013	0.5	Case Administration (includes co-counsel conferences not otherwise classified)
Anthony M. Stiegler	12/12/2013	0.2	Case Administration (includes co-counsel conferences not otherwise classified)
Anthony M. Stiegler	12/14/2013	0.5	Case Administration (includes co-counsel conferences not otherwise classified)
Anthony M. Stiegler	12/16/2013	0.1	Case Administration (includes co-counsel conferences not otherwise classified)
Anthony M. Stiegler	12/22/2013	0.3	Case Administration (includes co-counsel conferences not otherwise classified)

Timekeeper	Work Date	Hours	Task
Anthony M. Stiegler	12/23/2013	0.2	Case Administration (includes co-counsel conferences not otherwise classified)
Anthony M. Stiegler	12/30/2013	0.2	Discovery Disputes (not stipulated PO issue)
Anthony M. Stiegler	1/5/2014	0.3	Case Administration (includes co-counsel conferences not otherwise classified)
Anthony M. Stiegler	1/7/2014	0.5	Discovery Disputes (not stipulated PO issue)
Anthony M. Stiegler	1/9/2014	0.3	Case Administration (includes co-counsel conferences not otherwise classified)
Anthony M. Stiegler	1/10/2014	1.3	Case Administration (includes co-counsel conferences not otherwise classified)
Anthony M. Stiegler	1/11/2014	1.5	Case Administration (includes co-counsel conferences not otherwise classified)
Anthony M. Stiegler	1/15/2014	1	Case Administration (includes co-counsel conferences not otherwise classified)
Anthony M. Stiegler	1/16/2014	0.3	Case Administration (includes co-counsel conferences not otherwise classified)
Anthony M. Stiegler	1/17/2014	0.1	Case Administration (includes co-counsel conferences not otherwise classified)
Anthony M. Stiegler	1/21/2014	0.9	Case Administration (includes co-counsel conferences not otherwise classified)
Anthony M. Stiegler	1/22/2014	0.5	Case Administration (includes co-counsel conferences not otherwise classified)
Anthony M. Stiegler	1/23/2014	0.3	Case Administration (includes co-counsel conferences not otherwise classified)
Anthony M. Stiegler	2/7/2014	1.1	Stipulated Protective Order (including Negotiations, Legal Research and Motion Practice)
Anthony M. Stiegler	2/10/2014	0.2	Case Administration (includes co-counsel conferences not otherwise classified)
Anthony M. Stiegler	2/12/2014	0.8	Case Administration (includes co-counsel conferences not otherwise classified)
Anthony M. Stiegler	2/13/2014	1.1	Stipulated Protective Order (including Negotiations, Legal Research and Motion Practice)
Anthony M. Stiegler	2/17/2014	0.4	Case Administration (includes co-counsel conferences not otherwise classified)
Anthony M. Stiegler	2/18/2014	0.4	Case Administration (includes co-counsel conferences not otherwise classified)
Anthony M. Stiegler	2/19/2014	0.2	Case Administration (includes co-counsel conferences not otherwise classified)
Anthony M. Stiegler	2/20/2014	0.4	Case Administration (includes co-counsel conferences not otherwise classified)

Timekeeper	Work Date	Hours	Task
Anthony M. Stiegler	2/21/2014	0.3	Case Administration (includes co-counsel conferences not otherwise classified)
Anthony M. Stiegler	2/23/2014	0.3	Case Administration (includes co-counsel conferences not otherwise classified)
Anthony M. Stiegler	2/24/2014	0.2	Case Administration (includes co-counsel conferences not otherwise classified)
Anthony M. Stiegler	2/25/2014	0.6	Case Administration (includes co-counsel conferences not otherwise classified)
Anthony M. Stiegler	2/26/2014	0.2	Case Administration (includes co-counsel conferences not otherwise classified)
Anthony M. Stiegler	2/27/2014	0.3	Case Administration (includes co-counsel conferences not otherwise classified)
Anthony M. Stiegler	2/28/2014	0.5	Case Administration (includes co-counsel conferences not otherwise classified)
Anthony M. Stiegler	3/2/2014	0.2	Case Administration (includes co-counsel conferences not otherwise classified)
Anthony M. Stiegler	3/3/2014	0.7	Case Administration (includes co-counsel conferences not otherwise classified)
Anthony M. Stiegler	3/4/2014	0.5	Case Administration (includes co-counsel conferences not otherwise classified)
Anthony M. Stiegler	3/5/2014	2.1	Case Administration (includes co-counsel conferences not otherwise classified)
Anthony M. Stiegler	3/6/2014	0.5	Case Administration (includes co-counsel conferences not otherwise classified)
Anthony M. Stiegler	3/7/2014	0.3	Case Administration (includes co-counsel conferences not otherwise classified)
Anthony M. Stiegler	3/9/2014	0.4	Case Administration (includes co-counsel conferences not otherwise classified)
Anthony M. Stiegler	3/10/2014	0.8	Case Administration (includes co-counsel conferences not otherwise classified)
Anthony M. Stiegler	3/11/2014	0.5	Case Administration (includes co-counsel conferences not otherwise classified)
Anthony M. Stiegler	3/14/2014	0.5	Case Administration (includes co-counsel conferences not otherwise classified)
Anthony M. Stiegler	3/15/2014	0.2	Case Administration (includes co-counsel conferences not otherwise classified)
Anthony M. Stiegler	3/17/2014	0.5	Case Administration (includes co-counsel conferences not otherwise classified)
Anthony M. Stiegler	3/18/2014	0.7	Case Administration (includes co-counsel conferences not otherwise classified)
Anthony M. Stiegler	3/19/2014	0.9	Case Administration (includes co-counsel conferences not otherwise classified)
Anthony M. Stiegler	3/20/2014	1.5	Case Administration (includes co-counsel conferences not otherwise classified)

Timekeeper	Work Date	Hours	Task
Anthony M. Stiegler	3/21/2014	0.5	Case Administration (includes co-counsel conferences not otherwise classified)
Anthony M. Stiegler	3/23/2014	0.7	Case Administration (includes co-counsel conferences not otherwise classified)
Anthony M. Stiegler	3/24/2014	0.3	Case Administration (includes co-counsel conferences not otherwise classified)
Anthony M. Stiegler	3/25/2014	0.3	Case Administration (includes co-counsel conferences not otherwise classified)
Anthony M. Stiegler	3/26/2014	0.5	Case Administration (includes co-counsel conferences not otherwise classified)
Anthony M. Stiegler	3/27/2014	0.3	Case Administration (includes co-counsel conferences not otherwise classified)
Anthony M. Stiegler	3/28/2014	0.5	Case Administration (includes co-counsel conferences not otherwise classified)
Anthony M. Stiegler	3/31/2014	0.7	Case Administration (includes co-counsel conferences not otherwise classified)
Anthony M. Stiegler	4/1/2014	1.1	Case Administration (includes co-counsel conferences not otherwise classified)
Anthony M. Stiegler	4/2/2014	1.4	Case Administration (includes co-counsel conferences not otherwise classified)
Anthony M. Stiegler	4/3/2014	0.3	Case Administration (includes co-counsel conferences not otherwise classified)
Anthony M. Stiegler	4/4/2014	0.5	Case Administration (includes co-counsel conferences not otherwise classified)
Anthony M. Stiegler	4/7/2014	0.3	Negotiate and Draft Settlement Agreement
Anthony M. Stiegler	4/8/2014	1.1	Negotiate and Draft Settlement Agreement
Anthony M. Stiegler	4/9/2014	0.3	Negotiate and Draft Settlement Agreement
Anthony M. Stiegler	4/11/2014	0.5	Negotiate and Draft Settlement Agreement
Anthony M. Stiegler	4/13/2014	0.4	Negotiate and Draft Settlement Agreement
Anthony M. Stiegler	4/14/2014	0.5	Negotiate and Draft Settlement Agreement
Anthony M. Stiegler	4/15/2014	0.2	Negotiate and Draft Settlement Agreement
Anthony M. Stiegler	4/16/2014	0.5	Case Administration (includes co-counsel conferences not otherwise classified)
Anthony M. Stiegler	4/17/2014	0.6	Negotiate and Draft Settlement Agreement
Anthony M. Stiegler	4/18/2014	0.3	Negotiate and Draft Settlement Agreement

Timekeeper	Work Date	Hours	Task
Anthony M. Stiegler	4/22/2014	0.3	Negotiate and Draft Settlement Agreement
Anthony M. Stiegler	4/23/2014	0.3	Negotiate and Draft Settlement Agreement
Anthony M. Stiegler	4/28/2014	0.9	Negotiate and Draft Settlement Agreement
Anthony M. Stiegler	4/29/2014	0.2	Negotiate and Draft Settlement Agreement
Anthony M. Stiegler	4/30/2014	0.3	Negotiate and Draft Settlement Agreement
Anthony M. Stiegler	5/1/2014	0.3	Negotiate and Draft Settlement Agreement
Anthony M. Stiegler	5/2/2014	0.3	Negotiate and Draft Settlement Agreement
Anthony M. Stiegler	5/5/2014	0.2	Negotiate and Draft Settlement Agreement
Anthony M. Stiegler	5/6/2014	0.3	Negotiate and Draft Settlement Agreement
Anthony M. Stiegler	5/7/2014	0.3	Negotiate and Draft Settlement Agreement
Anthony M. Stiegler	5/8/2014	0.4	Negotiate and Draft Settlement Agreement
Anthony M. Stiegler	5/9/2014	0.3	Negotiate and Draft Settlement Agreement
Anthony M. Stiegler	5/13/2014	1.8	Negotiate and Draft Settlement Agreement
Anthony M. Stiegler	5/14/2014	0.9	Negotiate and Draft Settlement Agreement
Anthony M. Stiegler	5/16/2014	0.7	Negotiate and Draft Settlement Agreement
Anthony M. Stiegler	5/18/2014	0.3	Negotiate and Draft Settlement Agreement
Anthony M. Stiegler	5/19/2014	0.4	Negotiate and Draft Settlement Agreement
Anthony M. Stiegler	5/20/2014	0.4	Negotiate and Draft Settlement Agreement
Anthony M. Stiegler	5/21/2014	0.3	Negotiate and Draft Settlement Agreement
Anthony M. Stiegler	5/25/2014	0.5	Negotiate and Draft Settlement Agreement
Anthony M. Stiegler	5/28/2014	1.5	Case Administration (includes co-counsel conferences not otherwise classified)
Anthony M. Stiegler	5/29/2014	0.3	Negotiate and Draft Settlement Agreement

Timekeeper	Work Date	Hours	Task
Anthony M. Stiegler	5/31/2014	0.3	Case Administration (includes co-counsel conferences not otherwise classified)
Anthony M. Stiegler	6/2/2014	0.3	Negotiate and Draft Settlement Agreement
Anthony M. Stiegler	6/2/2014	0.3	Negotiate and Draft Settlement Agreement
Anthony M. Stiegler	6/12/2014	0.9	Case Administration (includes co-counsel conferences not otherwise classified)
Anthony M. Stiegler	6/13/2014	1.3	Case Administration (includes co-counsel conferences not otherwise classified)
Anthony M. Stiegler	6/14/2014	2.5	Case Administration (includes co-counsel conferences not otherwise classified)
Anthony M. Stiegler	6/17/2014	1	Case Administration (includes co-counsel conferences not otherwise classified)
Anthony M. Stiegler	6/18/2014	0.6	Case Administration (includes co-counsel conferences not otherwise classified)
Anthony M. Stiegler	6/19/2014	0.5	Case Administration (includes co-counsel conferences not otherwise classified)
Anthony M. Stiegler	6/20/2014	0.8	Negotiate and Draft Settlement Agreement
Anthony M. Stiegler	6/26/2014	0.5	Negotiate and Draft Settlement Agreement
Anthony M. Stiegler	6/27/2014	0.9	Negotiate and Draft Settlement Agreement
Anthony M. Stiegler	6/29/2014	1.2	Negotiate and Draft Settlement Agreement
Anthony M. Stiegler	7/1/2014	0.2	Negotiate and Draft Settlement Agreement
Anthony M. Stiegler	7/3/2014	0.3	Negotiate and Draft Settlement Agreement
Anthony M. Stiegler	7/7/2014	0.3	Negotiate and Draft Settlement Agreement
Anthony M. Stiegler	7/9/2014	0.3	Negotiate and Draft Settlement Agreement
Anthony M. Stiegler	7/10/2014	0.5	Negotiate and Draft Settlement Agreement
Anthony M. Stiegler	7/11/2014	0.2	Negotiate and Draft Settlement Agreement
Anthony M. Stiegler	7/14/2014	0.4	Negotiate and Draft Settlement Agreement
Anthony M. Stiegler	7/15/2014	0.8	Case Administration (includes co-counsel conferences not otherwise classified)
Anthony M. Stiegler	7/16/2014	0.9	Negotiate and Draft Settlement Agreement

Timekeeper	Work Date	Hours	Task
Anthony M. Stiegler	7/18/2014	0.2	Negotiate and Draft Settlement Agreement
Anthony M. Stiegler	7/21/2014	0.2	Negotiate and Draft Settlement Agreement
Anthony M. Stiegler	7/22/2014	0.3	Negotiate and Draft Settlement Agreement
Anthony M. Stiegler	7/23/2014	0.3	Negotiate and Draft Settlement Agreement
Anthony M. Stiegler	7/24/2014	0.3	Negotiate and Draft Settlement Agreement
Anthony M. Stiegler	7/27/2014	0.3	Negotiate and Draft Settlement Agreement
Anthony M. Stiegler	7/28/2014	0.2	Negotiate and Draft Settlement Agreement
Anthony M. Stiegler	7/29/2014	0.3	Negotiate and Draft Settlement Agreement
Anthony M. Stiegler	7/30/2014	0.4	Negotiate and Draft Settlement Agreement
Anthony M. Stiegler	8/5/2014	0.3	Negotiate and Draft Settlement Agreement
Anthony M. Stiegler	8/13/2014	0.9	Negotiate and Draft Settlement Agreement
Anthony M. Stiegler	8/14/2014	1.6	Obtain Preliminary Approval of Class-Wide Portion of Settlement Agreement and Provisional Class Certification
Anthony M. Stiegler	8/15/2014	0.5	Obtain Preliminary Approval of Class-Wide Portion of Settlement Agreement and Provisional Class Certification
Anthony M. Stiegler	8/18/2014	0.5	Obtain Preliminary Approval of Class-Wide Portion of Settlement Agreement and Provisional Class Certification
Anthony M. Stiegler	8/19/2014	0.5	Case Administration (includes co-counsel conferences not otherwise classified)
Anthony M. Stiegler	8/20/2014	0.6	Obtain Preliminary Approval of Class-Wide Portion of Settlement Agreement and Provisional Class Certification
Anthony M. Stiegler	8/21/2014	0.3	Obtain Preliminary Approval of Class-Wide Portion of Settlement Agreement and Provisional Class Certification
Anthony M. Stiegler	8/28/2014	1.3	Case Administration (includes co-counsel conferences not otherwise classified)
Anthony M. Stiegler	8/29/2014	0.8	Case Administration (includes co-counsel conferences not otherwise classified)
Anthony M. Stiegler	9/7/2014	0.2	Case Administration (includes co-counsel conferences not otherwise classified)

Timekeeper	Work Date	Hours	Task
Anthony M. Stiegler	9/9/2014	0.6	Case Administration (includes co-counsel conferences not otherwise classified)
Anthony M. Stiegler	9/10/2014	0.2	Case Administration (includes co-counsel conferences not otherwise classified)
Anthony M. Stiegler	9/17/2014	0.3	Case Administration (includes co-counsel conferences not otherwise classified)
Anthony M. Stiegler	9/22/2014	0.2	Case Administration (includes co-counsel conferences not otherwise classified)
Anthony M. Stiegler	9/23/2014	0.2	Case Administration (includes co-counsel conferences not otherwise classified)
Anthony M. Stiegler	9/29/2014	0.2	Supervise Provision of Notice to Class
Anthony M. Stiegler	9/30/2014	0.1	Supervise Provision of Notice to Class
Anthony M. Stiegler	10/2/2014	0.2	Case Administration (includes co-counsel conferences not otherwise classified)
Anthony M. Stiegler	10/6/2014	0.2	Case Administration (includes co-counsel conferences not otherwise classified)
Total		132.9	

Timekeeper	Work Date	Hours	Task
Leo P. Norton	3/13/2013	0.5	Fact and Legal Investigation and Drafting of Complaint/Amended Complaint
Leo P. Norton	12/13/2013	0.8	Prepare for Motion for Class Certification
Total		1.3	

Timekeeper	Work Date	Hours	Task
Brandon C. Batt	2/11/2013	0.2	Fact and Legal Investigation and Drafting of Complaint/Amended Complaint
Brandon C. Batt	2/13/2013	1.3	Case Administration (includes co-counsel conferences not otherwise classified)
Brandon C. Batt	2/21/2013	1.4	Case Administration (includes co-counsel conferences not otherwise classified)
Brandon C. Batt	2/25/2013	0.5	Locate and Communicate with Potential Class Members
Brandon C. Batt	2/27/2013	1.2	Fact and Legal Investigation and Drafting of Complaint/Amended Complaint
Brandon C. Batt	3/1/2013	0.7	Fact and Legal Investigation and Drafting of Complaint/Amended Complaint
Brandon C. Batt	3/4/2013	3	Fact and Legal Investigation and Drafting of Complaint/Amended Complaint
Brandon C. Batt	3/5/2013	1	Fact and Legal Investigation and Drafting of Complaint/Amended Complaint
Brandon C. Batt	3/6/2013	1.2	Fact and Legal Investigation and Drafting of Complaint/Amended Complaint
Brandon C. Batt	3/7/2013	1.9	Fact and Legal Investigation and Drafting of Complaint/Amended Complaint
Brandon C. Batt	3/14/2013	1.1	Case Administration (includes co-counsel conferences not otherwise classified)
Brandon C. Batt	3/21/2013	1.2	Case Administration (includes co-counsel conferences not otherwise classified)
Brandon C. Batt	4/3/2013	0.4	Locate and Communicate with Potential Class Members
Brandon C. Batt	4/4/2013	0.8	Fact and Legal Investigation and Drafting of Complaint/Amended Complaint
Brandon C. Batt	4/11/2013	0.7	Case Administration (includes co-counsel conferences not otherwise classified)
Brandon C. Batt	4/18/2013	0.4	Locate and Communicate with Potential Class Members
Brandon C. Batt	5/1/2013	0.4	Case Administration (includes co-counsel conferences not otherwise classified)
Brandon C. Batt	5/2/2013	1	Case Administration (includes co-counsel conferences not otherwise classified)
Brandon C. Batt	5/6/2013	0.5	Locate and Communicate with Potential Class Members
Brandon C. Batt	5/9/2013	1.2	Case Administration (includes co-counsel conferences not otherwise classified)
Brandon C. Batt	6/5/2013	0.3	Fact and Legal Investigation and Drafting of Complaint/Amended Complaint
Brandon C. Batt	6/13/2013	1.5	Case Administration (includes co-counsel conferences not otherwise classified)
Brandon C. Batt	6/18/2013	1.8	Locate and Communicate with Potential Class Members
Brandon C. Batt	6/19/2013	1.2	Locate and Communicate with Potential Class Members
Brandon C. Batt	6/20/2013	1.2	Case Administration (includes co-counsel conferences not otherwise classified)
Brandon C. Batt	6/28/2013	1.7	Case Administration (includes co-counsel conferences not otherwise classified); Locate and Communicate with Potential Class Members
Brandon C. Batt	7/11/2013	1.3	Case Administration (includes co-counsel conferences not otherwise classified)

Timekeeper	Work Date	Hours	Task
Brandon C. Batt	7/25/2013	0.7	Case Administration (includes co-counsel conferences not otherwise classified)
Brandon C. Batt	7/26/2013	0.5	Locate and Communicate with Potential Class Members
Brandon C. Batt	7/29/2013	1.4	Locate and Communicate with Potential Class Members
Brandon C. Batt	7/30/2013	1.3	Locate and Communicate with Potential Class Members
Brandon C. Batt	8/1/2013	1.2	Case Administration (includes co-counsel conferences not otherwise classified)
Brandon C. Batt	8/8/2013	1	Case Administration (includes co-counsel conferences not otherwise classified)
Brandon C. Batt	8/9/2013	0.5	Locate and Communicate with Potential Class Members
Brandon C. Batt	8/12/2013	2.6	Locate and Communicate with Potential Class Members
Brandon C. Batt	8/13/2013	2.3	Locate and Communicate with Potential Class Members
Brandon C. Batt	8/14/2013	2.5	Locate and Communicate with Potential Class Members
Brandon C. Batt	8/15/2013	0.4	Locate and Communicate with Potential Class Members
Brandon C. Batt	8/19/2013	0.7	Locate and Communicate with Potential Class Members
Brandon C. Batt	8/21/2013	0.3	Locate and Communicate with Potential Class Members
Brandon C. Batt	8/22/2013	1.8	Locate and Communicate with Potential Class Members
Brandon C. Batt	8/26/2013	0.5	Locate and Communicate with Potential Class Members
Brandon C. Batt	8/27/2013	0.5	Locate and Communicate with Potential Class Members
Brandon C. Batt	8/28/2013	0.4	Locate and Communicate with Potential Class Members
Brandon C. Batt	8/29/2013	0.3	Locate and Communicate with Potential Class Members
Brandon C. Batt	8/30/2013	0.2	Locate and Communicate with Potential Class Members
Brandon C. Batt	9/5/2013	1	Case Administration (includes co-counsel conferences not otherwise classified)
Brandon C. Batt	9/6/2013	0.2	Locate and Communicate with Potential Class Members
Brandon C. Batt	9/9/2013	0.1	Case Administration (includes co-counsel conferences not otherwise classified)
Brandon C. Batt	9/12/2013	0.9	Case Administration (includes co-counsel conferences not otherwise classified)
Brandon C. Batt	9/19/2013	0.8	Case Administration (includes co-counsel conferences not otherwise classified)
Brandon C. Batt	9/23/2013	0.4	Case Administration (includes co-counsel conferences not otherwise classified)
Brandon C. Batt	9/26/2013	0.8	Case Administration (includes co-counsel conferences not otherwise classified)
Brandon C. Batt	10/3/2013	0.2	Case Administration (includes co-counsel conferences not otherwise classified)
Brandon C. Batt	10/10/2013	1.1	Case Administration (includes co-counsel conferences not otherwise classified)
Brandon C. Batt	10/24/2013	1	Case Administration (includes co-counsel conferences not otherwise classified)
Brandon C. Batt	11/5/2013	0.2	Locate and Communicate with Potential Class Members
Brandon C. Batt	11/21/2013	0.5	Case Administration (includes co-counsel conferences not otherwise classified)
Brandon C. Batt	12/10/2013	0.5	Case Administration (includes co-counsel conferences not otherwise classified)
Brandon C. Batt	12/12/2013	0.3	Case Administration (includes co-counsel conferences not otherwise classified)
Brandon C. Batt	1/16/2014	0.2	Locate and Communicate with Potential Class Members
Brandon C. Batt	2/27/2014	0.9	Locate and Communicate with Potential Class Members

Timekeeper	Work Date	Hours	Task
Brandon C. Batt	3/11/2014	1	Locate and Communicate with Potential Class Members
Brandon C. Batt	3/19/2014	0.4	Locate and Communicate with Potential Class Members
Brandon C. Batt	3/21/2014	0.4	Locate and Communicate with Potential Class Members
Brandon C. Batt	4/3/2014	0.4	Locate and Communicate with Potential Class Members
Brandon C. Batt	4/10/2014	0.5	Locate and Communicate with Potential Class Members
Total		60	

Timekeeper	Work Date	Hours	Task
Matthew B. Krengel	7/17/2013	0.6	Collect, Review and Produce Documents Requested by Defendants
Matthew B. Krengel	7/30/2013	0.1	Collect, Review and Produce Documents Requested by Defendants
Matthew B. Krengel	8/29/2013	0.5	Collect, Review and Produce Documents Requested by Defendants
Matthew B. Krengel	9/6/2013	0.8	Rule 26(f) Conference and Report to Court
Matthew B. Krengel	9/17/2013	1.2	Collect, Review and Produce Documents Requested by Defendants
Matthew B. Krengel	12/20/2013	0.7	Collect, Review and Produce Documents Requested by Defendants
Matthew B. Krengel	1/7/2014	0.2	Discovery Disputes (Not stipulated PO issue)
Matthew B. Krengel	2/10/2014	0.8	Discovery Disputes (Not stipulated PO issue)
Matthew B. Krengel	2/24/2014	0.8	Discovery Disputes (Not stipulated PO issue)
Matthew B. Krengel	2/25/2014	0.4	Discovery Disputes (Not stipulated PO issue)
Matthew B. Krengel	2/26/2014	0.3	Discovery Disputes (Not stipulated PO issue)
Matthew B. Krengel	3/5/2014	0.6	Collect, Review and Produce Documents Requested by Defendants
Matthew B. Krengel	3/6/2014	2.1	Collect, Review and Produce Documents Requested by Defendants
Matthew B. Krengel	3/11/2014	1.6	Collect, Review and Produce Documents Requested by Defendants
Matthew B. Krengel	3/12/2014	1.2	Collect, Review and Produce Documents Requested by Defendants
Matthew B. Krengel	3/14/2014	2.7	Collect, Review and Produce Documents Requested by Defendants
Matthew B. Krengel	3/17/2014	1.8	Collect, Review and Produce Documents Requested by Defendants
Matthew B. Krengel	3/18/2014	1.7	Discovery Disputes (Not stipulated PO issue)
Matthew B. Krengel	3/19/2014	0.7	Collect, Review and Produce Documents Requested by Defendants
Matthew B. Krengel	3/24/2014	1.4	Collect, Review and Produce Documents Requested by Defendants
Matthew B. Krengel	3/25/2014	1.2	Discovery Disputes (Not stipulated PO issue)
Matthew B. Krengel	3/27/2014	0.2	Collect, Review and Produce Documents Requested by Defendants
Matthew B. Krengel	3/28/2014	2.7	Collect, Review and Produce Documents Requested by Defendants
Matthew B. Krengel	3/31/2014	2.2	Collect, Review and Produce Documents Requested by Defendants

Timekeeper	Work Date	Hours	Task
Matthew B. Krengel	4/1/2014	2.2	Collect, Review and Produce Documents Requested by Defendants
Matthew B. Krengel	4/2/2014	3.4	Collect, Review and Produce Documents Requested by Defendants
Matthew B. Krengel	4/3/2014	1.8	Collect, Review and Produce Documents Requested by Defendants
Matthew B. Krengel	4/7/2014	0.5	Discovery Disputes (Not stipulated PO issue)
Matthew B. Krengel	4/9/2014	2.1	Collect, Review and Produce Documents Requested by Defendants
Matthew B. Krengel	4/10/2014	1.3	Collect, Review and Produce Documents Requested by Defendants
Matthew B. Krengel	4/11/2014	1.3	Collect, Review and Produce Documents Requested by Defendants
Matthew B. Krengel	4/16/2014	0.5	Discovery Disputes (Not stipulated PO issue)
Matthew B. Krengel	4/17/2014	1.8	Collect, Review and Produce Documents Requested by Defendants
Matthew B. Krengel	4/28/2014	1.3	Collect, Review and Produce Documents Requested by Defendants
Total		42.7	

Timekeeper	Work Date	Hours	Task
Neda Weems	3/18/2014	0.5	Collect, Review and Produce Documents Requested by Defendants
Neda Weems	3/19/2014	0.4	Collect, Review and Produce Documents Requested by Defendants
Neda Weems	3/21/2014	0.6	Collect, Review and Produce Documents Requested by Defendants
Neda Weems	3/24/2014	1.1	Collect, Review and Produce Documents Requested by Defendants
Neda Weems	3/25/2014	0.5	Collect, Review and Produce Documents Requested by Defendants
Neda Weems	3/28/2014	1.1	Collect, Review and Produce Documents Requested by Defendants
Neda Weems	3/31/2014	0.4	Collect, Review and Produce Documents Requested by Defendants
Neda Weems	4/2/2014	1.4	Collect, Review and Produce Documents Requested by Defendants
Neda Weems	4/3/2014	0.4	Collect, Review and Produce Documents Requested by Defendants
Neda Weems	4/9/2014	1.1	Collect, Review and Produce Documents Requested by Defendants
Neda Weems	4/17/2014	0.9	Collect, Review and Produce Documents Requested by Defendants
Neda Weems	4/18/2014	0.6	Case Administration (includes co-counsel conferences not otherwise classified)
Neda Weems	4/21/2014	0.8	Case Administration (includes co-counsel conferences not otherwise classified)
Neda Weems	4/25/2014	0.7	Collect, Review and Produce Documents Requested by Defendants
Neda Weems	4/28/2014	2.9	Collect, Review and Produce Documents Requested by Defendants
Neda Weems	4/30/2014	1.1	Collect, Review and Produce Documents Requested by Defendants
Neda Weems	5/5/2014	0.5	Case Administration (includes co-counsel conferences not otherwise classified)
Total		15	

Timekeeper	Work	Hours	Task
Peter H. Dahlquist	2/13/2013	2.7	Fact and Legal Investigation and Drafting of Complaint/Amended Complaint
Peter H. Dahlquist	2/14/2013	4	Case Administration (includes co-counsel conferences not otherwise classified)
Peter H. Dahlquist	2/20/2013	1.8	Fact and Legal Investigation and Drafting of Complaint/Amended Complaint
Peter H. Dahlquist	2/21/2013	4.5	Fact and Legal Investigation and Drafting of Complaint/Amended Complaint
Peter H. Dahlquist	2/24/2013	0.3	Case Administration (includes co-counsel conferences not otherwise classified)
Peter H. Dahlquist	3/1/2013	1	Fact and Legal Investigation and Drafting of Complaint/Amended Complaint
Peter H. Dahlquist	3/2/2013	1	Fact and Legal Investigation and Drafting of Complaint/Amended Complaint
Peter H. Dahlquist	3/4/2013	4.2	Fact and Legal Investigation and Drafting of Complaint/Amended Complaint
Peter H. Dahlquist	3/6/2013	1.3	Fact and Legal Investigation and Drafting of Complaint/Amended Complaint
Peter H. Dahlquist	3/7/2013	2.2	Fact and Legal Investigation and Drafting of Complaint/Amended Complaint
Peter H. Dahlquist	3/9/2013	1.8	Fact and Legal Investigation and Drafting of Complaint/Amended Complaint
Peter H. Dahlquist	3/11/2013	1	Case Administration (includes co-counsel conferences not otherwise classified)
Peter H. Dahlquist	3/12/2013	1.2	Fact and Legal Investigation and Drafting of Complaint/Amended Complaint
Peter H. Dahlquist	3/13/2013	3.5	Fact and Legal Investigation and Drafting of Complaint/Amended Complaint
Peter H. Dahlquist	3/14/2013	3.2	Fact and Legal Investigation and Drafting of Complaint/Amended Complaint
Peter H. Dahlquist	3/19/2013	4.6	Fact and Legal Investigation and Drafting of Complaint/Amended Complaint
Peter H. Dahlquist	3/20/2013	0.5	Fact and Legal Investigation and Drafting of Complaint/Amended Complaint
Peter H. Dahlquist	3/21/2013	1.2	Fact and Legal Investigation and Drafting of Complaint/Amended Complaint
Peter H. Dahlquist	3/28/2013	1.1	Fact and Legal Investigation and Drafting of Complaint/Amended Complaint
Peter H. Dahlquist	3/30/2013	1.2	Fact and Legal Investigation and Drafting of Complaint/Amended Complaint
Peter H. Dahlquist	3/31/2013	3.4	Fact and Legal Investigation and Drafting of Complaint/Amended Complaint
Peter H. Dahlquist	4/1/2013	1	Fact and Legal Investigation and Drafting of Complaint/Amended Complaint
Peter H. Dahlquist	4/3/2013	0.5	Locate and Communicate with Potential Class Members
Peter H. Dahlquist	4/4/2013	2	Fact and Legal Investigation and Drafting of Complaint/Amended Complaint

Timekeeper	Work	Hours	Task
Peter H. Dahlquist	4/5/2013	5.8	Fact and Legal Investigation and Drafting of Complaint/Amended Complaint
Peter H. Dahlquist	4/11/2013	3	Fact and Legal Investigation and Drafting of Complaint/Amended Complaint
Peter H. Dahlquist	4/15/2013	1.1	Fact and Legal Investigation and Drafting of Complaint/Amended Complaint
Peter H. Dahlquist	4/16/2013	5.5	Fact and Legal Investigation and Drafting of Complaint/Amended Complaint
Peter H. Dahlquist	4/17/2013	2.7	Fact and Legal Investigation and Drafting of Complaint/Amended Complaint
Peter H. Dahlquist	4/18/2013	1	Fact and Legal Investigation and Drafting of Complaint/Amended Complaint
Peter H. Dahlquist	4/20/2013	2.5	Fact and Legal Investigation and Drafting of Complaint/Amended Complaint
Peter H. Dahlquist	4/21/2013	3.5	Fact and Legal Investigation and Drafting of Complaint/Amended Complaint
Peter H. Dahlquist	4/22/2013	4.5	Fact and Legal Investigation and Drafting of Complaint/Amended Complaint
Peter H. Dahlquist	4/23/2013	3.2	Fact and Legal Investigation and Drafting of Complaint/Amended Complaint
Peter H. Dahlquist	4/24/2013	1.7	Fact and Legal Investigation and Drafting of Complaint/Amended Complaint
Peter H. Dahlquist	4/25/2013	1.7	Fact and Legal Investigation and Drafting of Complaint/Amended Complaint
Peter H. Dahlquist	4/30/2013	2	Fact and Legal Investigation and Drafting of Complaint/Amended Complaint
Peter H. Dahlquist	5/1/2013	0.5	Locate and Communicate with Potential Class Members
Peter H. Dahlquist	5/2/2013	2.3	Locate and Communicate with Potential Class Members
Peter H. Dahlquist	5/6/2013	0.4	Locate and Communicate with Potential Class Members
Peter H. Dahlquist	5/9/2013	1	Case Administration (includes co-counsel conferences not otherwise classified)
Peter H. Dahlquist	5/16/2013	1	Fact and Legal Investigation and Drafting of Complaint/Amended Complaint
Peter H. Dahlquist	5/21/2013	1.2	Fact and Legal Investigation and Drafting of Complaint/Amended Complaint
Peter H. Dahlquist	5/22/2013	1.7	Fact and Legal Investigation and Drafting of Complaint/Amended Complaint
Peter H. Dahlquist	5/24/2013	3.7	Fact and Legal Investigation and Drafting of Complaint/Amended Complaint
Peter H. Dahlquist	5/28/2013	4.2	Fact and Legal Investigation and Drafting of Complaint/Amended Complaint
Peter H. Dahlquist	5/29/2013	0.4	Locate and Communicate with Potential Class Members
Peter H. Dahlquist	5/30/2013	1	Case Administration (includes co-counsel conferences not otherwise classified)

Timekeeper	Work	Hours	Task
Peter H. Dahlquist	6/3/2013	1.2	Fact and Legal Investigation and Drafting of Complaint/Amended Complaint
Peter H. Dahlquist	6/4/2013	1.2	Fact and Legal Investigation and Drafting of Complaint/Amended Complaint
Peter H. Dahlquist	6/6/2013	1.6	Case Administration (includes co-counsel conferences not otherwise classified)
Peter H. Dahlquist	6/11/2013	1	Case Administration (includes co-counsel conferences not otherwise classified)
Peter H. Dahlquist	6/12/2013	1.4	Case Administration (includes co-counsel conferences not otherwise classified)
Peter H. Dahlquist	6/13/2013	0.5	Case Administration (includes co-counsel conferences not otherwise classified)
Peter H. Dahlquist	6/17/2013	0.4	Case Administration (includes co-counsel conferences not otherwise classified)
Peter H. Dahlquist	6/20/2013	2.7	Prepare for Motion for Class Certification
Peter H. Dahlquist	6/21/2013	2	Prepare for Motion for Class Certification
Peter H. Dahlquist	6/23/2013	1	Opposing Defendants' Motion(s) to Dismiss (other than Court hearing)
Peter H. Dahlquist	6/24/2013	2	Case Administration (includes co-counsel conferences not otherwise classified)
Peter H. Dahlquist	6/25/2013	1.6	Case Administration (includes co-counsel conferences not otherwise classified)
Peter H. Dahlquist	6/26/2013	0.5	Prepare for Motion for Class Certification
Peter H. Dahlquist	6/27/2013	0.8	Case Administration (includes co-counsel conferences not otherwise classified)
Peter H. Dahlquist	7/3/2013	1	Case Administration (includes co-counsel conferences not otherwise classified)
Peter H. Dahlquist	7/15/2013	0.3	Case Administration (includes co-counsel conferences not otherwise classified)
Peter H. Dahlquist	7/18/2013	1	Case Administration (includes co-counsel conferences not otherwise classified)
Peter H. Dahlquist	7/25/2013	1	Case Administration (includes co-counsel conferences not otherwise classified)
Peter H. Dahlquist	7/26/2013	0.7	Stipulated Protective Order (including Negotiations, Legal Research and Motion Practice)
Peter H. Dahlquist	7/29/2013	2	Stipulated Protective Order (including Negotiations, Legal Research and Motion Practice)
Peter H. Dahlquist	7/30/2013	1	Stipulated Protective Order (including Negotiations, Legal Research and Motion Practice)
Peter H. Dahlquist	8/1/2013	0.3	Case Administration (includes co-counsel conferences not otherwise classified)

Timekeeper	Work	Hours	Task
Peter H. Dahlquist	8/8/2013	3	Opposing Defendants' Motion to Transfer Venue (other than Court hearing)
Peter H. Dahlquist	8/9/2013	3.7	Opposing Defendants' Motion to Transfer Venue (other than Court hearing)
Peter H. Dahlquist	8/12/2013	8	Opposing Defendants' Motion to Transfer Venue (other than Court hearing); Draft Written Discovery to Serve on Defendants (RFAs, RFPs, ROGs, Depo Notices); Locate and Communicate with Potential Class Members
Peter H. Dahlquist	8/13/2013	5	Opposing Defendants' Motion to Transfer Venue (other than Court hearing); Locate and Communicate with Potential Class Members
Peter H. Dahlquist	8/14/2013	4.8	Opposing Defendants' Motion to Transfer Venue (other than Court hearing); Locate and Communicate with Potential Class Members
Peter H. Dahlquist	8/15/2013	2.5	Opposing Defendants' Motion to Transfer Venue (other than Court hearing); Case Administration (includes co-counsel conferences not otherwise classified); Locate and Communicate with Potential Class Members
Peter H. Dahlquist	8/16/2013	1.3	Opposing Defendants' Motion to Transfer Venue (other than Court hearing)
Peter H. Dahlquist	8/19/2013	1	Opposing Defendants' Motion to Transfer Venue (other than Court hearing)
Peter H. Dahlquist	8/22/2013	2.3	Locate and Communicate with Potential Class Members; Rule 26(f) Conference and Report to Court
Peter H. Dahlquist	8/23/2013	1.7	Opposing Defendants' Motion to Transfer Venue (other than Court hearing)
Peter H. Dahlquist	8/26/2013	1.5	Opposing Defendants' Motion to Transfer Venue (other than Court hearing)
Peter H. Dahlquist	8/28/2013	3.7	Locate and Communicate with Potential Class Members; Rule 26(f) Conference and Report to Court
Peter H. Dahlquist	8/29/2013	1.2	Draft Written Discovery to Serve on Defendants (RFAs, RFPs, ROGs)
Peter H. Dahlquist	8/30/2013	5	Opposing Defendants' Motion to Transfer Venue (other than Court hearing)
Peter H. Dahlquist	9/2/2013	1	Draft Written Discovery to Serve on Defendants (RFAs, RFPs, ROGs)
Peter H. Dahlquist	9/3/2013	3.2	Discovery Disputes (Not stipulated PO issue)
Peter H. Dahlquist	9/4/2013	3	Discovery Disputes (Not stipulated PO issue)
Peter H. Dahlquist	9/5/2013	2.7	Discovery Disputes (Not stipulated PO issue)
Peter H. Dahlquist	9/6/2013	1.4	Rule 26(f) Conference and Report to Court

Timekeeper	Work	Hours	Task
Peter H. Dahlquist	9/9/2013	1.7	Discovery Disputes (Not stipulated PO issue)
Peter H. Dahlquist	9/10/2013	0.6	Prepare for Motion for Class Certification
Peter H. Dahlquist	9/11/2013	1.6	Opposing Defendants' Motion(s) to Dismiss (other than Court hearing); Prepare for Motion for Class Certification
Peter H. Dahlquist	9/12/2013	2.4	Opposing Defendants' Motion(s) to Dismiss (other than Court hearing); Rule 26(f) Conference and Report to Court; Case Administration (includes co-counsel conferences not otherwise classified);
Peter H. Dahlquist	9/13/2013	1.6	Rule 26(f) Conference and Report to Court
Peter H. Dahlquist	9/16/2013	5	Other Discovery (initial disclosures, third party discovery, etc.); Hearing on Motion to Transfer Venue and Rule 16(b) Status Conference
Peter H. Dahlquist	9/17/2013	7.5	Hearing on Motion to Transfer Venue and Rule 16(b) Status Conference; Prepare for Motion for Class Certification
Peter H. Dahlquist	9/18/2013	3.2	Prepare for Motion for Class Certification
Peter H. Dahlquist	9/19/2013	3.5	Rule 26(f) Conference and Report to Court
Peter H. Dahlquist	9/20/2013	1	Rule 26(f) Conference and Report to Court
Peter H. Dahlquist	9/24/2013	0.6	Fact and Legal Investigation and Drafting of Complaint/Amended Complaint
Peter H. Dahlquist	9/25/2013	2	Fact and Legal Investigation and Drafting of Complaint/Amended Complaint
Peter H. Dahlquist	9/26/2013	1.7	Case Administration (includes co-counsel conferences not otherwise classified)
Peter H. Dahlquist	10/1/2013	0.5	Case Administration (includes co-counsel conferences not otherwise classified)
Peter H. Dahlquist	10/2/2013	3.3	Fact and Legal Investigation and Drafting of Complaint/Amended Complaint
Peter H. Dahlquist	10/7/2013	1.5	Draft Written Discovery to Serve on Defendants (RFAs, RFPs, ROGs)
Peter H. Dahlquist	10/8/2013	0.3	Case Administration (includes co-counsel conferences not otherwise classified)
Peter H. Dahlquist	10/10/2013	1.3	Case Administration (includes co-counsel conferences not otherwise classified)
Peter H. Dahlquist	10/16/2013	0.7	Prepare for Motion for Class Certification
Peter H. Dahlquist	10/21/2013	4	Case Administration (includes co-counsel conferences not otherwise classified); Other Discovery (initial disclosures, third party discovery, etc.)

Timekeeper	Work	Hours	Task
Peter H. Dahlquist	10/24/2013	1.8	Case Administration (includes co-counsel conferences not otherwise classified); Other Discovery (initial disclosures, third party discovery, etc.)
Peter H. Dahlquist	10/28/2013	3.3	Plaintiffs' Motion for Preliminary Injunction (other than Court hearing)
Peter H. Dahlquist	10/29/2013	4.8	Plaintiffs' Motion for Preliminary Injunction (other than Court hearing)
Peter H. Dahlquist	10/30/2013	5	Plaintiffs' Motion for Preliminary Injunction (other than Court hearing); Locate and Communicate with Potential Class Members
Peter H. Dahlquist	10/31/2013	7	Plaintiffs' Motion for Preliminary Injunction (other than Court hearing); Locate and Communicate with Potential Class Members; Case Administration (includes co-counsel conferences not otherwise classified)
Peter H. Dahlquist	11/1/2013	4.6	Plaintiffs' Motion for Preliminary Injunction (other than Court hearing)
Peter H. Dahlquist	11/3/2013	1.5	Plaintiffs' Motion for Preliminary Injunction (other than Court hearing)
Peter H. Dahlquist	11/4/2013	8.1	Plaintiffs' Motion for Preliminary Injunction (other than Court hearing)
Peter H. Dahlquist	11/5/2013	1	Plaintiffs' Motion for Preliminary Injunction (other than Court hearing)
Peter H. Dahlquist	11/11/2013	2	Opposing Defendants' Motion(s) to Dismiss (other than Court hearing)
Peter H. Dahlquist	11/12/2013	3.5	Opposing Defendants' Motion(s) to Dismiss (other than Court hearing)
Peter H. Dahlquist	11/13/2013	4.5	Opposing Defendants' Motion(s) to Dismiss (other than Court hearing)
Peter H. Dahlquist	11/14/2013	1.8	Opposing Defendants' Motion(s) to Dismiss (other than Court hearing)
Peter H. Dahlquist	11/21/2013	0.7	Case Administration (includes co-counsel conferences not otherwise classified)
Peter H. Dahlquist	11/22/2013	0.5	Opposing Defendants' Motion(s) to Dismiss (other than Court hearing)
Peter H. Dahlquist	11/27/2013	0.2	Plaintiffs' Motion for Preliminary Injunction (other than Court hearing)
Peter H. Dahlquist	12/1/2013	3	Plaintiffs' Motion for Preliminary Injunction (other than Court hearing)
Peter H. Dahlquist	12/2/2013	1.5	Plaintiffs' Motion for Preliminary Injunction (other than Court hearing)
Peter H. Dahlquist	12/3/2013	0.5	Discovery Disputes (Not stipulated PO issue)
Peter H. Dahlquist	12/6/2013	0.8	Opposing Defendants' Motion(s) to Dismiss (other than Court hearing)
Peter H. Dahlquist	12/9/2013	7.5	Hearing: Motion for Preliminary Injunction and Motion to Dismiss

Timekeeper	Work	Hours	Task
Peter H. Dahlquist	12/10/2013	1	Prepare for Motion for Class Certification
Peter H. Dahlquist	12/11/2013	3.3	Prepare for Motion for Class Certification; Hearing: Motion for Preliminary Injunction and Motion to Dismiss
Peter H. Dahlquist	12/12/2013	1.7	Prepare for Motion for Class Certification
Peter H. Dahlquist	12/13/2013	3.5	Prepare for Motion for Class Certification
Peter H. Dahlquist	12/15/2013	3.5	Discovery Disputes (Not stipulated PO issue)
Peter H. Dahlquist	12/16/2013	5.1	Discovery Disputes (Not stipulated PO issue)
Peter H. Dahlquist	12/17/2013	2.2	Discovery Disputes (Not stipulated PO issue)
Peter H. Dahlquist	12/19/2013	0.5	Case Administration (includes co-counsel conferences not otherwise classified)
Peter H. Dahlquist	12/19/2013	2.6	Prepare for Motion for Class Certification
Peter H. Dahlquist	12/20/2013	0.9	Discovery Disputes (Not stipulated PO issue)
Peter H. Dahlquist	12/20/2013	2.6	Stipulated Protective Order (including Negotiations, Legal Research and Motion Practice)
Peter H. Dahlquist	12/22/2013	3	Stipulated Protective Order (including Negotiations, Legal Research and Motion Practice)
Peter H. Dahlquist	12/23/2013	2	Discovery Disputes (Not stipulated PO issue)
Peter H. Dahlquist	12/30/2013	1	Hearing: Motion for Preliminary Injunction and Motion to Dismiss
Peter H. Dahlquist	12/31/2013	0.5	Discovery Disputes (Not stipulated PO issue)
Peter H. Dahlquist	1/2/2014	2	Discovery Disputes (Not stipulated PO issue)
Peter H. Dahlquist	1/3/2014	2.8	Stipulated Protective Order (including Negotiations, Legal Research and Motion Practice)
Peter H. Dahlquist	1/3/2014	3.1	Discovery Disputes (Not stipulated PO issue)
Peter H. Dahlquist	1/4/2014	3.1	Discovery Disputes (Not stipulated PO issue)
Peter H. Dahlquist	1/4/2014	0.3	Stipulated Protective Order (including Negotiations, Legal Research and Motion Practice)
Peter H. Dahlquist	1/5/2014	1.5	Discovery Disputes (Not stipulated PO issue)

Timekeeper	Work	Hours	Task
Peter H. Dahlquist	1/5/2014	2	Stipulated Protective Order (including Negotiations, Legal Research and Motion Practice)
Peter H. Dahlquist	1/6/2014	7.9	Stipulated Protective Order (including Negotiations, Legal Research and Motion Practice)
Peter H. Dahlquist	1/6/2014	1.1	Discovery Disputes (Not stipulated PO issue)
Peter H. Dahlquist	1/7/2014	0.6	Discovery Disputes (Not stipulated PO issue)
Peter H. Dahlquist	1/7/2014	6.4	Stipulated Protective Order (including Negotiations, Legal Research and Motion Practice)
Peter H. Dahlquist	1/8/2014	1	Discovery Disputes (Not stipulated PO issue)
Peter H. Dahlquist	1/9/2014	2	Discovery Disputes (Not stipulated PO issue)
Peter H. Dahlquist	1/10/2014	1	Case Administration (includes co-counsel conferences not otherwise classified)
Peter H. Dahlquist	1/13/2014	0.2	Draft Written Discovery to Serve on Defendants (RFAs, RFPs, ROGs)
Peter H. Dahlquist	1/13/2014	0.5	Locate and Communicate with Potential Class Members
Peter H. Dahlquist	1/14/2014	0.9	Case Administration (includes co-counsel conferences not otherwise classified)
Peter H. Dahlquist	1/15/2014	0.5	Case Administration (includes co-counsel conferences not otherwise classified)
Peter H. Dahlquist	1/16/2014	1.8	Case Administration (includes co-counsel conferences not otherwise classified)
Peter H. Dahlquist	1/16/2014	0.3	Locate and Communicate with Potential Class Members
Peter H. Dahlquist	1/16/2014	1.1	Discovery Disputes (Not stipulated PO issue)
Peter H. Dahlquist	1/17/2014	1.2	Discovery Disputes (Not stipulated PO issue)
Peter H. Dahlquist	1/20/2014	2	Discovery Disputes (Not stipulated PO issue)
Peter H. Dahlquist	1/20/2014	1.4	Stipulated Protective Order (including Negotiations, Legal Research and Motion Practice)
Peter H. Dahlquist	1/21/2014	0.2	Discovery Disputes (Not stipulated PO issue)
Peter H. Dahlquist	1/21/2014	0.2	Case Administration (includes co-counsel conferences not otherwise classified)
Peter H. Dahlquist	1/21/2014	0.5	Stipulated Protective Order (including Negotiations, Legal Research and Motion Practice)

Timekeeper	Work	Hours	Task
Peter H. Dahlquist	1/22/2014	0.5	Draft Written Discovery to Serve on Defendants (RFAs, RFPs, ROGs)
Peter H. Dahlquist	1/23/2014	2.6	Draft Written Discovery to Serve on Defendants (RFAs, RFPs, ROGs)
Peter H. Dahlquist	1/23/2014	2.5	Prepare for Motion for Class Certification
Peter H. Dahlquist	1/24/2014	0.2	Prepare for Motion for Class Certification
Peter H. Dahlquist	1/24/2014	2.1	Depositions by Plaintiffs (includes prep)
Peter H. Dahlquist	1/24/2014	0.5	Discovery Disputes (Not stipulated PO issue)
Peter H. Dahlquist	1/27/2014	0.5	Depositions by Plaintiffs (includes prep)
Peter H. Dahlquist	1/28/2014	4.4	Depositions by Plaintiffs (includes prep)
Peter H. Dahlquist	1/28/2014	3	Discovery Disputes (Not stipulated PO issue)
Peter H. Dahlquist	1/29/2014	1.9	Depositions by Plaintiffs (includes prep)
Peter H. Dahlquist	1/30/2014	6	Depositions by Plaintiffs (includes prep)
Peter H. Dahlquist	1/30/2014	0.3	Prepare for Motion for Class Certification
Peter H. Dahlquist	1/31/2014	7.9	Depositions by Plaintiffs (includes prep)
Peter H. Dahlquist	2/6/2014	0.6	Stipulated Protective Order (including Negotiations, Legal Research and Motion Practice)
Peter H. Dahlquist	2/6/2014	4.4	Discovery Disputes (Not stipulated PO issue)
Peter H. Dahlquist	2/7/2014	3.1	Discovery Disputes (Not stipulated PO issue)
Peter H. Dahlquist	2/12/2014	0.7	Stipulated Protective Order (including Negotiations, Legal Research and Motion Practice)
Peter H. Dahlquist	2/13/2014	1	Case Administration (includes co-counsel conferences not otherwise classified)
Peter H. Dahlquist	2/14/2014	0.4	Draft Written Discovery to Serve on Defendants (RFAs, RFPs, ROGs)
Peter H. Dahlquist	2/18/2014	2	Locate and Communicate with Potential Class Members
Peter H. Dahlquist	2/19/2014	0.5	Respond to Written Discovery Served by Defendants (RFPs, RFA, ROGs)
Peter H. Dahlquist	2/20/2014	1.5	Locate and Communicate with Potential Class Members
Peter H. Dahlquist	2/20/2014	0.7	Respond to Written Discovery Served by Defendants (RFPs, RFA, ROGs)

Timekeeper	Work	Hours	Task
Peter H. Dahlquist	2/20/2014	0.2	Stipulated Protective Order (including Negotiations, Legal Research and Motion Practice)
Peter H. Dahlquist	2/21/2014	1.9	Case Administration (includes co-counsel conferences not otherwise classified)
Peter H. Dahlquist	2/21/2014	2.8	Prepare for Motion for Class Certification
Peter H. Dahlquist	2/24/2014	1	Locate and Communicate with Potential Class Members
Peter H. Dahlquist	2/24/2014	2	Respond to Written Discovery Served by Defendants (RFPs, RFA, ROGs)
Peter H. Dahlquist	2/24/2014	1.9	Prepare for Motion for Class Certification
Peter H. Dahlquist	2/25/2014	2	Respond to Written Discovery Served by Defendants (RFPs, RFA, ROGs)
Peter H. Dahlquist	2/26/2014	1	Collect, Review and Produce Documents Requested by Defendants
Peter H. Dahlquist	2/27/2014	1	Locate and Communicate with Potential Class Members
Peter H. Dahlquist	3/3/2014	0.3	Respond to Written Discovery Served by Defendants (RFPs, RFA, ROGs)
Peter H. Dahlquist	3/3/2014	4.3	Depositions by Plaintiffs (includes prep)
Peter H. Dahlquist	3/5/2014	1.6	Prepare for Motion for Class Certification
Peter H. Dahlquist	3/5/2014	3.8	Respond to Written Discovery Served by Defendants (RFPs, RFA, ROGs)
Peter H. Dahlquist	3/6/2014	4.1	Respond to Written Discovery Served by Defendants (RFPs, RFA, ROGs)
Peter H. Dahlquist	3/7/2014	0.3	Locate and Communicate with Potential Class Members
Peter H. Dahlquist	3/10/2014	1.8	Respond to Written Discovery Served by Defendants (RFPs, RFA, ROGs)
Peter H. Dahlquist	3/11/2014	0.5	Depositions by Defendants (includes prep)
Peter H. Dahlquist	3/12/2014	2.4	Depositions by Defendants (includes prep)
Peter H. Dahlquist	3/12/2014	0.2	Collect, Review and Produce Documents Requested by Defendants
Peter H. Dahlquist	3/13/2014	1.4	Case Administration (includes co-counsel conferences not otherwise classified)
Peter H. Dahlquist	3/13/2014	0.3	Depositions by Defendants (includes prep)
Peter H. Dahlquist	3/13/2014	1.5	Prepare for Motion for Class Certification
Peter H. Dahlquist	3/14/2014	1	Depositions by Defendants (includes prep)

Timekeeper	Work	Hours	Task
Peter H. Dahlquist	3/14/2014	3	Collect, Review and Produce Documents Requested by Defendants
Peter H. Dahlquist	3/16/2014	1.6	Collect, Review and Produce Documents Requested by Defendants
Peter H. Dahlquist	3/16/2014	1.5	Depositions by Defendants (includes prep)
Peter H. Dahlquist	3/17/2014	7.6	Depositions by Defendants (includes prep)
Peter H. Dahlquist	3/18/2014	1	Prepare for Motion for Class Certification
Peter H. Dahlquist	3/18/2014	2.3	Depositions by Defendants (includes prep)
Peter H. Dahlquist	3/18/2014	2	Collect, Review and Produce Documents Requested by Defendants
Peter H. Dahlquist	3/19/2014	4.6	Depositions by Defendants (includes prep)
Peter H. Dahlquist	3/20/2014	6.6	Depositions by Defendants (includes prep)
Peter H. Dahlquist	3/21/2014	1.5	Collect, Review and Produce Documents Requested by Defendants
Peter H. Dahlquist	3/21/2014	1	Case Administration (includes co-counsel conferences not otherwise classified)
Peter H. Dahlquist	3/21/2014	0.5	Locate and Communicate with Potential Class Members
Peter H. Dahlquist	3/24/2014	3.5	Collect, Review and Produce Documents Requested by Defendants
Peter H. Dahlquist	3/24/2014	1.5	Prepare for Motion for Class Certification
Peter H. Dahlquist	3/25/2014	0.6	Prepare for Motion for Class Certification
Peter H. Dahlquist	3/26/2014	1.1	Prepare for Motion for Class Certification
Peter H. Dahlquist	3/27/2014	2	Prepare for Motion for Class Certification
Peter H. Dahlquist	3/28/2014	2.5	Stipulated Protective Order (including Negotiations, Legal Research and Motion Practice)
Peter H. Dahlquist	3/30/2014	1	Prepare for Motion for Class Certification
Peter H. Dahlquist	3/31/2014	3.3	Prepare for Motion for Class Certification
Peter H. Dahlquist	3/31/2014	0.6	Expert Witnesses
Peter H. Dahlquist	3/31/2014	0.4	Collect, Review and Produce Documents Requested by Defendants
Peter H. Dahlquist	4/2/2014	0.3	Discovery Disputes (Not stipulated PO issue)

Timekeeper	Work	Hours	Task
Peter H. Dahlquist	4/2/2014	1.5	Prepare for Motion for Class Certification
Peter H. Dahlquist	4/3/2014	1	Locate and Communicate with Potential Class Members
Peter H. Dahlquist	4/3/2014	1.2	Case Administration (includes co-counsel conferences not otherwise classified)
Peter H. Dahlquist	4/3/2014	0.3	Collect, Review and Produce Documents Requested by Defendants
Peter H. Dahlquist	4/4/2014	1	Prepare for Motion for Class Certification
Peter H. Dahlquist	4/7/2014	0.5	Prepare for Motion for Class Certification
Peter H. Dahlquist	4/7/2014	0.5	Discovery Disputes (Not stipulated PO issue)
Peter H. Dahlquist	4/8/2014	3	Discovery Disputes (Not stipulated PO issue)
Peter H. Dahlquist	4/8/2014	0.2	Prepare for Motion for Class Certification
Peter H. Dahlquist	4/9/2014	1	Depositions by Plaintiffs (includes prep and digests)
Peter H. Dahlquist	4/9/2014	1.5	Prepare for Motion for Class Certification
Peter H. Dahlquist	4/10/2014	1	Discovery Disputes (Not stipulated PO issue)
Peter H. Dahlquist	4/11/2014	0.5	Prepare for Motion for Class Certification
Peter H. Dahlquist	4/15/2014	0.6	Prepare for Motion for Class Certification
Peter H. Dahlquist	4/17/2014	2.5	Negotiate and Draft Settlement Agreement
Total		523.5	

Timekeeper	Work Date	Hours	Task
Neal R. Gibeault	10/23/2014	0.5	Attorneys Fees Motion
Neal R. Gibeault	10/24/2014	2.4	Attorneys Fees Motion
Neal R. Gibeault	10/27/2014	1.1	Attorneys Fees Motion
Neal R. Gibeault	10/29/2014	2.4	Attorneys Fees Motion
Neal R. Gibeault	10/30/2014	3.3	Attorneys Fees Motion
Neal R. Gibeault	11/5/2014	0.8	Attorneys Fees Motion
Neal R. Gibeault	11/6/2014	2.2	Attorneys Fees Motion
Neal R. Gibeault	11/8/2014	3.6	Attorneys Fees Motion
Neal R. Gibeault	11/9/2014	5.7	Attorneys Fees Motion
Neal R. Gibeault	11/10/2014	1.5	Attorneys Fees Motion
Neal R. Gibeault	11/11/2014	4.3	Attorneys Fees Motion
Neal R. Gibeault	11/12/2014	0.9	Attorneys Fees Motion
Neal R. Gibeault	11/13/2014	0.7	Case Administration (includes co-counsel conferences not otherwise classified)
Neal R. Gibeault	11/5/2014	0.8	Attorneys Fees Motion
Neal R. Gibeault	11/6/2014	2.2	Attorneys Fees Motion
Neal R. Gibeault	11/8/2014	3.6	Attorneys Fees Motion
Neal R. Gibeault	11/9/2014	5.7	Attorneys Fees Motion
Neal R. Gibeault	11/10/2014	1.5	Attorneys Fees Motion
Neal R. Gibeault	11/11/2014	4.3	Attorneys Fees Motion
Neal R. Gibeault	11/12/2014	0.9	Attorneys Fees Motion
Neal R. Gibeault	11/13/2014	0.7	Case Administration (includes co-counsel conferences not otherwise classified)
Neal R. Gibeault	11/24/2014	1.7	Case Administration (includes co-counsel conferences not otherwise classified)
Neal R. Gibeault	11/25/2014	0.3	Attorneys Fees Motion
Neal R. Gibeault	11/26/2014	2.8	Attorneys Fees Motion
Neal R. Gibeault	11/26/2014	0.6	Attorneys Fees Motion
Neal R. Gibeault	11/28/2014	2.4	Attorneys Fees Motion
Neal R. Gibeault	11/29/2014	1	Attorneys Fees Motion
Neal R. Gibeault	11/30/2014	1.4	Attorneys Fees Motion
Total		59.3	

Timekeeper	Work Date	Hours	Task
Michael J. Nieto	2/13/2013	1.3	Case Administration (includes co-counsel conferences not otherwise classified)
Michael J. Nieto	2/19/2013	2	Fact and Legal Investigation and Drafting of Complaint/Amended Complaint
Michael J. Nieto	2/20/2013	0.5	Fact and Legal Investigation and Drafting of Complaint/Amended Complaint
Michael J. Nieto	2/21/2013	1.8	Case Administration (includes co-counsel conferences not otherwise classified)
Michael J. Nieto	2/27/2013	0.3	Fact and Legal Investigation and Drafting of Complaint/Amended Complaint
Michael J. Nieto	3/3/2013	1	Fact and Legal Investigation and Drafting of Complaint/Amended Complaint
Michael J. Nieto	3/4/2013	3	Fact and Legal Investigation and Drafting of Complaint/Amended Complaint
Michael J. Nieto	3/5/2013	1.2	Fact and Legal Investigation and Drafting of Complaint/Amended Complaint
Michael J. Nieto	3/6/2013	1.2	Fact and Legal Investigation and Drafting of Complaint/Amended Complaint
Michael J. Nieto	3/7/2013	3.4	Fact and Legal Investigation and Drafting of Complaint/Amended Complaint
Michael J. Nieto	3/12/2013	1	Prepare for Motion for Class Certification
Michael J. Nieto	3/13/2013	4.2	Prepare for Motion for Class Certification
Michael J. Nieto	3/14/2013	2.7	Fact and Legal Investigation and Drafting of Complaint/Amended Complaint
Michael J. Nieto	3/18/2013	1.8	Fact and Legal Investigation and Drafting of Complaint/Amended Complaint
Michael J. Nieto	3/19/2013	2.6	Prepare for Motion for Class Certification
Michael J. Nieto	3/20/2013	0.6	Prepare for Motion for Class Certification
Michael J. Nieto	3/21/2013	1.2	Case Administration (includes co-counsel conferences not otherwise classified)
Michael J. Nieto	3/28/2013	2.9	Fact and Legal Investigation and Drafting of Complaint/Amended Complaint
Michael J. Nieto	4/3/2013	0.5	Locate and Communicate with Potential Class Members
Michael J. Nieto	4/4/2013	2	Fact and Legal Investigation and Drafting of Complaint/Amended Complaint
Michael J. Nieto	4/8/2013	0.3	Case Administration (includes co-counsel conferences not otherwise classified)
Michael J. Nieto	4/9/2013	1.2	Fact and Legal Investigation and Drafting of Complaint/Amended Complaint
Michael J. Nieto	4/11/2013	2.4	Fact and Legal Investigation and Drafting of Complaint/Amended Complaint
Michael J. Nieto	4/16/2013	0.3	Locate and Communicate with Potential Class Members
Michael J. Nieto	4/18/2013	1.1	Locate and Communicate with Potential Class Members
Michael J. Nieto	4/22/2013	1.4	Fact and Legal Investigation and Drafting of Complaint/Amended Complaint

Timekeeper	Work Date	Hours	Task
Michael J. Nieto	4/25/2013	1.2	Fact and Legal Investigation and Drafting of Complaint/Amended Complaint
Michael J. Nieto	4/30/2013	0.3	Locate and Communicate with Potential Class Members
Michael J. Nieto	5/1/2013	2	Locate and Communicate with Potential Class Members
Michael J. Nieto	5/2/2013	1.2	Locate and Communicate with Potential Class Members
Michael J. Nieto	5/2/2013	1	Case Administration (includes co-counsel conferences not otherwise classified)
Michael J. Nieto	5/6/2013	1.2	Locate and Communicate with Potential Class Members
Michael J. Nieto	5/9/2013	1.1	Case Administration (includes co-counsel conferences not otherwise classified)
Michael J. Nieto	5/15/2013	0.8	Fact and Legal Investigation and Drafting of Complaint/Amended Complaint
Michael J. Nieto	5/16/2013	0.8	Fact and Legal Investigation and Drafting of Complaint/Amended Complaint
Michael J. Nieto	5/22/2013	0.5	Fact and Legal Investigation and Drafting of Complaint/Amended Complaint
Michael J. Nieto	6/3/2013	1.4	Fact and Legal Investigation and Drafting of Complaint/Amended Complaint
Michael J. Nieto	6/6/2013	1.8	Fact and Legal Investigation and Drafting of Complaint/Amended Complaint
Michael J. Nieto	6/10/2013	0.3	Case Administration (includes co-counsel conferences not otherwise classified)
Michael J. Nieto	6/11/2013	1	Fact and Legal Investigation and Drafting of Complaint/Amended Complaint
Michael J. Nieto	6/12/2013	0.3	Fact and Legal Investigation and Drafting of Complaint/Amended Complaint
Michael J. Nieto	6/13/2013	0.2	Fact and Legal Investigation and Drafting of Complaint/Amended Complaint
Michael J. Nieto	6/14/2013	0.3	Fact and Legal Investigation and Drafting of Complaint/Amended Complaint
Michael J. Nieto	6/17/2013	0.3	Case Administration (includes co-counsel conferences not otherwise classified)
Michael J. Nieto	6/18/2013	3.5	Locate and Communicate with Potential Class Members
Michael J. Nieto	6/19/2013	3.7	Locate and Communicate with Potential Class Members
Michael J. Nieto	6/20/2013	1.6	Locate and Communicate with Potential Class Members
Michael J. Nieto	6/21/2013	1	Opposing Defendants' Motion to Transfer Venue (other than Court hearing)
Michael J. Nieto	6/21/2013	0.5	Opposing Defendants' Motion to Transfer Venue (other than Court hearing)
Michael J. Nieto	6/21/2013	0.5	Locate and Communicate with Potential Class Members

Timekeeper	Work Date	Hours	Task
Michael J. Nieto	6/23/2013	0.7	Fact and Legal Investigation and Drafting of Complaint/Amended Complaint; Locate and Communicate with Potential Class Members
Michael J. Nieto	6/24/2013	2.2	Fact and Legal Investigation and Drafting of Complaint/Amended Complaint; Locate and Communicate with Potential Class Members
Michael J. Nieto	6/25/2013	0.3	Case Administration (includes co-counsel conferences not otherwise classified)
Michael J. Nieto	6/27/2013	0.8	Opposing Defendants' Motion(s) to Dismiss (other than Court hearing)
Michael J. Nieto	7/1/2013	0.6	Opposing Defendants' Motion to Transfer Venue (other than Court hearing)
Michael J. Nieto	7/2/2013	0.3	Case Administration (includes co-counsel conferences not otherwise classified)
Michael J. Nieto	7/3/2013	1.9	Locate and Communicate with Potential Class Members
Michael J. Nieto	7/5/2013	0.2	Locate and Communicate with Potential Class Members
Michael J. Nieto	7/9/2013	0.2	Rule 26(f) Conference and Report to Court
Michael J. Nieto	7/11/2013	1.2	Case Administration (includes co-counsel conferences not otherwise classified)
Michael J. Nieto	7/12/2013	0.2	Case Administration (includes co-counsel conferences not otherwise classified)
Michael J. Nieto	7/16/2013	0.5	Locate and Communicate with Potential Class Members
Michael J. Nieto	7/17/2013	1.5	Fact and Legal Investigation and Drafting of Complaint/Amended Complaint; Locate and Communicate with Potential Class Members
Michael J. Nieto	7/18/2013	3	Locate and Communicate with Potential Class Members
Michael J. Nieto	7/21/2013	0.3	Communicate with Defendants Not Otherwise Classified (includes meet and confers regarding schedule)
Michael J. Nieto	7/22/2013	0.6	Locate and Communicate with Potential Class Members
Michael J. Nieto	7/24/2013	0.7	Negotiate and Draft Settlement Agreement
Michael J. Nieto	7/25/2013	1.4	Negotiate and Draft Settlement Agreement
Michael J. Nieto	7/26/2013	0.5	Locate and Communicate with Potential Class Members
Michael J. Nieto	7/29/2013	1.8	Locate and Communicate with Potential Class Members
Michael J. Nieto	7/30/2013	3.8	Locate and Communicate with Potential Class Members
Michael J. Nieto	7/31/2013	1.3	Locate and Communicate with Potential Class Members
Michael J. Nieto	8/1/2013	1.4	Case Administration (includes co-counsel conferences not otherwise classified)

Timekeeper	Work Date	Hours	Task
Michael J. Nieto	8/6/2013	0.4	Locate and Communicate with Potential Class Members
Michael J. Nieto	8/7/2013	0.3	Case Administration (includes co-counsel conferences not otherwise classified)
Michael J. Nieto	8/8/2013	1.2	Case Administration (includes co-counsel conferences not otherwise classified)
Michael J. Nieto	8/9/2013	0.7	Opposing Defendants' Motion to Transfer Venue (other than Court hearing); Locate and Communicate with Potential Class Members
Michael J. Nieto	8/10/2013	2.1	Locate and Communicate with Potential Class Members
Michael J. Nieto	8/12/2013	3.2	Locate and Communicate with Potential Class Members
Michael J. Nieto	8/13/2013	0.8	Locate and Communicate with Potential Class Members
Michael J. Nieto	8/14/2013	2	Locate and Communicate with Potential Class Members
Michael J. Nieto	8/15/2013	2.1	Locate and Communicate with Potential Class Members
Michael J. Nieto	8/16/2013	0.2	Case Administration (includes co-counsel conferences not otherwise classified)
Michael J. Nieto	8/19/2013	0.7	Locate and Communicate with Potential Class Members
Michael J. Nieto	8/20/2013	1.3	Locate and Communicate with Potential Class Members
Michael J. Nieto	8/21/2013	0.6	Locate and Communicate with Potential Class Members
Michael J. Nieto	8/22/2013	1.4	Locate and Communicate with Potential Class Members
Michael J. Nieto	8/23/2013	2.4	Rule 26(f) Conference and Report to Court; Locate and Communicate with Potential Class Members; Communicate with Defendants Not Othwise Classified (includes meet and confers regarding schedule); Stipulated Protective Order (including Negotiations, Legal Research and Motion Practice)
Michael J. Nieto	8/25/2013	0.2	Rule 26(f) Conference and Report to Court
Michael J. Nieto	8/26/2013	0.8	Case Administration (includes co-counsel conferences not otherwise classified)
Michael J. Nieto	8/27/2013	2.1	Locate and Communicate with Potential Class Members
Michael J. Nieto	8/28/2013	4.8	Locate and Communicate with Potential Class Members
Michael J. Nieto	8/29/2013	2.3	Locate and Communicate with Potential Class Members
Michael J. Nieto	8/30/2013	2.4	Locate and Communicate with Potential Class Members

Timekeeper	Work Date	Hours	Task
Michael J. Nieto	8/31/2013	0.2	Case Administration (includes co-counsel conferences not otherwise classified)
Michael J. Nieto	9/1/2013	0.2	Case Administration (includes co-counsel conferences not otherwise classified)
Michael J. Nieto	9/2/2013	0.1	Case Administration (includes co-counsel conferences not otherwise classified)
Michael J. Nieto	9/3/2013	2.2	Locate and Communicate with Potential Class Members
Michael J. Nieto	9/4/2013	1.3	Locate and Communicate with Potential Class Members
Michael J. Nieto	9/5/2013	1.6	Locate and Communicate with Potential Class Members
Michael J. Nieto	9/6/2013	1	Locate and Communicate with Potential Class Members
Michael J. Nieto	9/9/2013	0.8	Locate and Communicate with Potential Class Members
Michael J. Nieto	9/10/2013	0.2	Locate and Communicate with Potential Class Members
Michael J. Nieto	9/11/2013	1.1	Locate and Communicate with Potential Class Members
Michael J. Nieto	9/12/2013	1.5	Case Administration (includes co-counsel conferences not otherwise classified)
Michael J. Nieto	9/16/2013	0.4	Rule 26(f) Conference and Report to Court; Locate and Communicate with Potential Class Members
Michael J. Nieto	9/18/2013	1.9	Locate and Communicate with Potential Class Members
Michael J. Nieto	9/19/2013	1.7	Rule 26(f) Conference and Report to Court; Opposing Defendants' Motion(s) to Dismiss (other than Court hearing); Locate and Communicate with Potential Class Members; Case Administration (includes co-counsel conferences not otherwise classified)
Michael J. Nieto	9/20/2013	0.8	Other Discovery (initial disclosures, third party discovery, etc.); Rule 26(f) Conference and Report to Court; Locate and Communicate with Potential Class Members
Michael J. Nieto	9/23/2013	0.6	Locate and Communicate with Potential Class Members
Michael J. Nieto	9/24/2013	1	Locate and Communicate with Potential Class Members
Michael J. Nieto	9/25/2013	1.4	Locate and Communicate with Potential Class Members
Michael J. Nieto	9/26/2013	3.3	Locate and Communicate with Potential Class Members
Michael J. Nieto	9/29/2013	0.4	Case Administration (includes co-counsel conferences not otherwise classified)

Timekeeper	Work Date	Hours	Task
Michael J. Nieto	9/30/2013	1.1	Locate and Communicate with Potential Class Members
Michael J. Nieto	10/1/2013	1.1	Fact and Legal Investigation and Drafting of Complaint/Amended Complaint
Michael J. Nieto	10/2/2013	0.8	Fact and Legal Investigation and Drafting of Complaint/Amended Complaint
Michael J. Nieto	10/3/2013	0.8	Case Administration (includes co-counsel conferences not otherwise classified)
Michael J. Nieto	10/4/2013	0.5	Discovery Disputes (Not stipulated PO issue)
Michael J. Nieto	10/7/2013	0.9	Case Administration (includes co-counsel conferences not otherwise classified)
Michael J. Nieto	10/8/2013	0.5	Stipulated Protective Order (including Negotiations, Legal Research and Motion Practice)
Michael J. Nieto	10/9/2013	0.3	Plaintiffs' Motion for Preliminary Injunction (other than Court hearing)
Michael J. Nieto	10/10/2013	2.3	Locate and Communicate with Potential Class Members
Michael J. Nieto	10/11/2013	0.5	Case Administration (includes co-counsel conferences not otherwise classified)
Michael J. Nieto	10/14/2013	0.3	Locate and Communicate with Potential Class Members
Michael J. Nieto	10/16/2013	0.2	Locate and Communicate with Potential Class Members
Michael J. Nieto	10/18/2013	0.4	Locate and Communicate with Potential Class Members
Michael J. Nieto	10/21/2013	1.6	Locate and Communicate with Potential Class Members
Michael J. Nieto	10/22/2013	0.3	Locate and Communicate with Potential Class Members
Michael J. Nieto	10/23/2013	0.2	Opposing Defendants' Motion to Transfer Venue (other than Court hearing)
Michael J. Nieto	10/24/2013	0.3	Case Administration (includes co-counsel conferences not otherwise classified)
Michael J. Nieto	10/28/2013	0.4	Locate and Communicate with Potential Class Members
Michael J. Nieto	10/31/2013	2.7	Locate and Communicate with Potential Class Members
Michael J. Nieto	11/4/2013	0.3	Plaintiffs' Motion for Preliminary Injunction (other than Court hearing)
Michael J. Nieto	11/5/2013	3.1	Locate and Communicate with Potential Class Members
Michael J. Nieto	11/6/2013	1.8	Locate and Communicate with Potential Class Members
Michael J. Nieto	11/20/2013	0.1	Stipulated Protective Order (including Negotiations, Legal Research and Motion Practice)

Timekeeper	Work Date	Hours	Task
Michael J. Nieto	11/21/2013	0.7	Case Administration (includes co-counsel conferences not otherwise classified)
Michael J. Nieto	11/25/2013	0.2	Plaintiffs' Motion for Preliminary Injunction (other than Court hearing)
Michael J. Nieto	12/1/2013	0.4	Plaintiffs' Motion for Preliminary Injunction (other than Court hearing)
Michael J. Nieto	12/2/2013	1.2	Plaintiffs' Motion for Preliminary Injunction (other than Court hearing)
Michael J. Nieto	12/3/2013	1.1	Discovery Disputes (Not stipulated PO issue)
Michael J. Nieto	12/4/2013	0.4	Case Administration (includes co-counsel conferences not otherwise classified)
Michael J. Nieto	12/5/2013	0.3	Case Administration (includes co-counsel conferences not otherwise classified)
Michael J. Nieto	12/6/2013	1.8	Plaintiffs' Motion for Preliminary Injunction (other than Court hearing)
Michael J. Nieto	12/9/2013	0.9	Discovery Disputes (not stipulated PO issue); Case Administration (includes co-counsel conferences not otherwise classified)
Michael J. Nieto	12/10/2013	1.3	Discovery Disputes (Not stipulated PO issue)
Michael J. Nieto	12/11/2013	3	Plaintiffs' Motion for Preliminary Injunction (other than Court hearing); Draft Written Discovery to Serve on Defendants (RFAs, RFPs, ROGs, Depo Notices)
Michael J. Nieto	12/12/2013	1.7	Case Administration (includes co-counsel conferences not otherwise classified)
Michael J. Nieto	12/13/2013	0.6	Plaintiffs' Motion for Preliminary Injunction (other than Court hearing)
Michael J. Nieto	12/16/2013	1.1	Discovery Disputes (Not stipulated PO issue)
Michael J. Nieto	12/17/2013	0.4	Case Administration (includes co-counsel conferences not otherwise classified)
Michael J. Nieto	12/18/2013	0.3	Depositions by Plaintiffs (includes prep)
Michael J. Nieto	12/19/2013	1.4	Case Administration (includes co-counsel conferences not otherwise classified)
Michael J. Nieto	12/20/2013	1.5	Plaintiffs' Motion for Preliminary Injunction (other than Court hearing); Prepare for Motion for Class Certification; Stipulated Protective Order (including Negotiations, Legal Research and Motion Practice); Discovery Disputes (not stipulated PO issue)
Michael J. Nieto	12/23/2013	1.4	Stipulated Protective Order (including Negotiations, Legal Research and Motion Practice)
Michael J. Nieto	12/30/2013	1.2	Case Administration (includes co-counsel conferences not otherwise classified)
Michael J. Nieto	1/2/2014	1.7	Locate and Communicate with Potential Class Members
Michael J. Nieto	1/3/2014	2	Respond to Written Discovery Served by Defendants (RFPs, RFA, ROGs)

Timekeeper	Work Date	Hours	Task
Michael J. Nieto	1/6/2014	1.1	Locate and Communicate with Potential Class Members
Michael J. Nieto	1/7/2014	1.7	Stipulated Protective Order (including Negotiations, Legal Research and Motion Practice)
Michael J. Nieto	1/8/2014	2.1	Draft Written Discovery to Serve on Defendants (RFAs, RFPs, ROGs)
Michael J. Nieto	1/9/2014	2.1	Discovery Disputes (not stipulated PO issue); Case Administration (includes co-counsel conferences not otherwise classified)
Michael J. Nieto	1/10/2014	1.2	Case Administration (includes co-counsel conferences not otherwise classified)
Michael J. Nieto	1/14/2014	0.7	Stipulated Protective Order (including Negotiations, Legal Research and Motion Practice)
Michael J. Nieto	1/15/2014	0.6	Stipulated Protective Order (including Negotiations, Legal Research and Motion Practice)
Michael J. Nieto	1/16/2014	2.6	Discovery Disputes (not stipulated PO issue); Case Administration (includes co-counsel conferences not otherwise classified); Prepare for Motion for Class Certification; Locate and Communicate with Potential Class Members
Michael J. Nieto	1/17/2014	1.1	Discovery Disputes (not stipulated PO issue); Locate and Communicate with Potential Class Members; Expert Witnesses
Michael J. Nieto	1/21/2014	0.9	Documents Produced by Defendants; Depositions by Plaintiffs (includes prep and digests); Expert Witnesses
Michael J. Nieto	1/22/2014	0.4	Stipulated Protective Order (including Negotiations, Legal Research and Motion Practice)
Michael J. Nieto	1/23/2014	2.3	Case Administration (includes co-counsel conferences not otherwise classified)
Michael J. Nieto	1/24/2014	1.3	Depositions by Plaintiffs (includes prep and digests); Discovery Disputes (not stipulated PO issue); Communicate with Defendants Not Othwise Classified (includes meet and confers regarding schedule)
Michael J. Nieto	1/26/2014	0.5	Draft Written Discovery to Serve on Defendants (RFAs, RFPs, ROGs)
Michael J. Nieto	1/27/2014	0.8	Depositions by Plaintiffs (includes prep)
Michael J. Nieto	1/28/2014	0.4	Depositions by Plaintiffs (includes prep)
Michael J. Nieto	1/29/2014	1.4	Discovery Disputes (Not stipulated PO issue); Depositions by Plaintiffs (includes prep and digests)
Michael J. Nieto	2/3/2014	0.1	Case Administration (includes co-counsel conferences not otherwise classified)

Timekeeper	Work Date	Hours	Task
Michael J. Nieto	2/8/2014	0.4	Case Administration (includes co-counsel conferences not otherwise classified)
Michael J. Nieto	2/11/2014	0.8	Discovery Disputes (Not stipulated PO issue)
Michael J. Nieto	2/12/2014	1.1	Case Administration (includes co-counsel conferences not otherwise classified)
Michael J. Nieto	2/13/2014	2.3	Case Administration (includes co-counsel conferences not otherwise classified)
Michael J. Nieto	2/14/2014	0.5	Stipulated Protective Order (including Negotiations, Legal Research and Motion Practice)
Michael J. Nieto	2/15/2014	0.2	Discovery Disputes (Not stipulated PO issue)
Michael J. Nieto	2/17/2014	0.4	Draft Written Discovery to Serve on Defendants (RFAs, RFPs, ROGs)
Michael J. Nieto	2/18/2014	0.8	Locate and Communicate with Potential Class Members; Depositions by Plaintiffs (includes prep and digests)
Michael J. Nieto	2/19/2014	0.3	Discovery Disputes (Not stipulated PO issue)
Michael J. Nieto	2/20/2014	0.6	Respond to Written Discovery Served by Defendants (RFPs, RFA, ROGs)
Michael J. Nieto	2/21/2014	1.3	Case Administration (includes co-counsel conferences not otherwise classified)
Michael J. Nieto	2/23/2014	0.2	Negotiate and Draft Settlement Agreement
Michael J. Nieto	2/24/2014	0.4	Negotiate and Draft Settlement Agreement
Michael J. Nieto	2/25/2014	1.5	Locate and Communicate with Potential Class Members; Depositions by Defendants (includes prep)
Michael J. Nieto	2/26/2014	0.6	Depositions by Defendants (includes prep)
Michael J. Nieto	2/27/2014	1.7	Collect, Review and Produce Documents Requested by Defendants
Michael J. Nieto	2/28/2014	1.2	Case Administration (includes co-counsel conferences not otherwise classified)
Michael J. Nieto	3/4/2014	0.4	Depositions by Plaintiffs (includes prep)
Michael J. Nieto	3/5/2014	1.1	Case Administration (includes co-counsel conferences not otherwise classified)
Michael J. Nieto	3/6/2014	0.2	Case Administration (includes co-counsel conferences not otherwise classified)
Michael J. Nieto	3/7/2014	0.4	Negotiate and Draft Settlement Agreement
Michael J. Nieto	3/9/2014	0.2	Draft Written Discovery to Serve on Defendants (RFAs, RFPs, ROGs, Depo Notices)
Michael J. Nieto	3/10/2014	0.8	Collect, Review and Produce Documents Requested by Defendants
Michael J. Nieto	3/11/2014	0.4	Depositions by Defendants (includes prep)
Michael J. Nieto	3/12/2014	1.2	Collect, Review and Produce Documents Requested by Defendants
Michael J. Nieto	3/13/2014	1.1	Case Administration (includes co-counsel conferences not otherwise classified)
Michael J. Nieto	3/14/2014	0.2	Discovery Disputes (Not stipulated PO issue)

Timekeeper	Work Date	Hours	Task
Total		234.2	

Timekeeper	Work Date	Hours	Task
Lindsay P. Chapman	1/7/2014	3.7	Prepare for Motion for Class Certification
Lindsay P. Chapman	1/8/2014	0.5	Prepare for Motion for Class Certification
Lindsay P. Chapman	1/14/2014	1.7	Prepare for Motion for Class Certification
Lindsay P. Chapman	1/15/2014	1.4	Prepare for Motion for Class Certification
Lindsay P. Chapman	1/16/2014	2.1	Prepare for Motion for Class Certification
Lindsay P. Chapman	1/21/2014	7.1	Prepare for Motion for Class Certification
Lindsay P. Chapman	1/22/2014	4	Prepare for Motion for Class Certification
Lindsay P. Chapman	1/23/2014	2.5	Prepare for Motion for Class Certification
Lindsay P. Chapman	1/24/2014	7.2	Prepare for Motion for Class Certification
Lindsay P. Chapman	1/30/2014	1.5	Draft Written Discovery to Serve on Defendants (RFAs, RFPs, ROGs)
Lindsay P. Chapman	2/27/2014	0.7	Collect, Review and Produce Documents Requested by Defendants
Lindsay P. Chapman	2/28/2014	0.8	Collect, Review and Produce Documents Requested by Defendants
Lindsay P. Chapman	3/2/2014	0.8	Collect, Review and Produce Documents Requested by Defendants
Lindsay P. Chapman	3/3/2014	1.4	Collect, Review and Produce Documents Requested by Defendants
Lindsay P. Chapman	3/4/2014	0.7	Collect, Review and Produce Documents Requested by Defendants
Lindsay P. Chapman	3/5/2014	2.2	Respond to Written Discovery Served by Defendants (RFPs, RFA, ROGs)
Lindsay P. Chapman	3/12/2014	5.7	Collect, Review and Produce Documents Requested by Defendants
Lindsay P. Chapman	3/13/2014	1.3	Case Administration (includes co-counsel conferences not otherwise classified)
Total		45.3	

Timekeeper	Work Date	Hours	Task
Kevin S. Henderson	2/21/2013	1.5	Case Administration (includes co-counsel conferences not otherwise classified)
Kevin S. Henderson	2/28/2013	0.3	Locate and Communicate with Potential Class Members
Kevin S. Henderson	3/1/2013	0.5	Locate and Communicate with Potential Class Members
Kevin S. Henderson	3/7/2013	1.2	Case Administration (includes co-counsel conferences not otherwise classified)
Kevin S. Henderson	3/21/2013	1.1	Case Administration (includes co-counsel conferences not otherwise classified)
Kevin S. Henderson	4/4/2013	1	Case Administration (includes co-counsel conferences not otherwise classified)
Kevin S. Henderson	4/11/2013	0.8	Case Administration (includes co-counsel conferences not otherwise classified)
Kevin S. Henderson	4/22/2013	1.1	Case Administration (includes co-counsel conferences not otherwise classified)
Kevin S. Henderson	4/25/2013	1	Case Administration (includes co-counsel conferences not otherwise classified)
Kevin S. Henderson	5/9/2013	1.1	Case Administration (includes co-counsel conferences not otherwise classified)
Kevin S. Henderson	6/6/2013	1.1	Case Administration (includes co-counsel conferences not otherwise classified)
Kevin S. Henderson	6/20/2013	0.9	Case Administration (includes co-counsel conferences not otherwise classified)
Kevin S. Henderson	6/27/2013	0.8	Case Administration (includes co-counsel conferences not otherwise classified)
Kevin S. Henderson	7/11/2013	1.1	Case Administration (includes co-counsel conferences not otherwise classified)
Kevin S. Henderson	7/18/2013	1.2	Case Administration (includes co-counsel conferences not otherwise classified)
Kevin S. Henderson	7/26/2013	0.1	Case Administration (includes co-counsel conferences not otherwise classified)
Kevin S. Henderson	8/1/2013	1.3	Case Administration (includes co-counsel conferences not otherwise classified)
Kevin S. Henderson	8/13/2013	0.2	Locate and Communicate with Potential Class Members
Kevin S. Henderson	8/22/2013	1.2	Case Administration (includes co-counsel conferences not otherwise classified)
Kevin S. Henderson	9/5/2013	1.3	Case Administration (includes co-counsel conferences not otherwise classified)
Kevin S. Henderson	10/10/2013	1.2	Case Administration (includes co-counsel conferences not otherwise classified)
Kevin S. Henderson	10/21/2013	1.1	Case Administration (includes co-counsel conferences not otherwise classified)
Kevin S. Henderson	12/12/2013	1	Case Administration (includes co-counsel conferences not otherwise classified)
Kevin S. Henderson	1/2/2014	1.2	Case Administration (includes co-counsel conferences not otherwise classified)

Timekeeper	Work Date	Hours	Task
Kevin S. Henderson	2/27/2014	1.2	Case Administration (includes co-counsel conferences not otherwise classified)
Kevin S. Henderson	4/3/2014	0.1	Locate and Communicate with Potential Class Members
Total		24.6	

Timekeeper	Work Date	Hours	Task
Jose R. Rodriguez	2/24/2014	5.5	Prepare for Motion for Class Certification
Jose R. Rodriguez	2/25/2014	3.5	Prepare for Motion for Class Certification
Jose R. Rodriguez	2/27/2014	1.1	Prepare for Motion for Class Certification
Jose R. Rodriguez	3/5/2014	1.3	Case Administration (includes co-counsel conferences not otherwise classified)
Jose R. Rodriguez	3/12/2014	2.4	Depositions by Defendants (includes prep)
Jose R. Rodriguez	3/13/2014	4.1	Depositions by Defendants (includes prep)
Jose R. Rodriguez	3/14/2014	4.6	Collect, Review and Produce Documents Requested by Defendants
Jose R. Rodriguez	3/17/2014	5.5	Collect, Review and Produce Documents Requested by Defendants
Jose R. Rodriguez	3/18/2014	2.2	Collect, Review and Produce Documents Requested by Defendants
Jose R. Rodriguez	3/20/2014	0.4	Collect, Review and Produce Documents Requested by Defendants
Jose R. Rodriguez	3/21/2014	1.1	Case Administration (includes co-counsel conferences not otherwise classified)
Total		31.7	

Timekeeper	Work Date	Hours	Task
Darcie A. Tilly	2/13/2013	1.2	Case Administration (includes co-counsel conferences not otherwise classified)
Darcie A. Tilly	2/21/2013	1.9	Case Administration (includes co-counsel conferences not otherwise classified)
Darcie A. Tilly	2/24/2013	1.5	Fact and Legal Investigation and Drafting of Complaint/Amended Complaint
Darcie A. Tilly	2/26/2013	2.1	Fact and Legal Investigation and Drafting of Complaint/Amended Complaint
Darcie A. Tilly	2/27/2013	0.5	Fact and Legal Investigation and Drafting of Complaint/Amended Complaint
Darcie A. Tilly	2/28/2013	0.5	Fact and Legal Investigation and Drafting of Complaint/Amended Complaint
Darcie A. Tilly	3/6/2013	2.8	Fact and Legal Investigation and Drafting of Complaint/Amended Complaint
Darcie A. Tilly	3/7/2013	1.7	Case Administration (includes co-counsel conferences not otherwise classified)
Darcie A. Tilly	3/13/2013	2.0	Fact and Legal Investigation and Drafting of Complaint/Amended Complaint
Darcie A. Tilly	3/14/2013	1.7	Case Administration (includes co-counsel conferences not otherwise classified)
Darcie A. Tilly	3/18/2013	2.2	Fact and Legal Investigation and Drafting of Complaint/Amended Complaint
Darcie A. Tilly	3/21/2013	1.4	Case Administration (includes co-counsel conferences not otherwise classified)
Darcie A. Tilly	3/28/2013	2.9	Fact and Legal Investigation and Drafting of Complaint/Amended Complaint
Darcie A. Tilly	3/29/2013	4.1	Fact and Legal Investigation and Drafting of Complaint/Amended Complaint
Darcie A. Tilly	3/31/2013	4.2	Fact and Legal Investigation and Drafting of Complaint/Amended Complaint
Darcie A. Tilly	4/1/2013	4.0	Fact and Legal Investigation and Drafting of Complaint/Amended Complaint
Darcie A. Tilly	4/2/2013	0.3	Fact and Legal Investigation and Drafting of Complaint/Amended Complaint
Darcie A. Tilly	4/3/2013	3.8	Fact and Legal Investigation and Drafting of Complaint/Amended Complaint
Darcie A. Tilly	4/4/2013	1.7	Fact and Legal Investigation and Drafting of Complaint/Amended Complaint
Darcie A. Tilly	4/5/2013	2.4	Fact and Legal Investigation and Drafting of Complaint/Amended Complaint
Darcie A. Tilly	4/7/2013	3.7	Fact and Legal Investigation and Drafting of Complaint/Amended Complaint
Darcie A. Tilly	4/8/2013	1.4	Fact and Legal Investigation and Drafting of Complaint/Amended Complaint
Darcie A. Tilly	4/10/2013	0.9	Case Administration (includes co-counsel conferences not otherwise classified)
Darcie A. Tilly	4/11/2013	2.3	Case Administration (includes co-counsel conferences not otherwise classified)

Timekeeper	Work Date	Hours	Task
Darcie A. Tilly	4/15/2013	2.4	Fact and Legal Investigation and Drafting of Complaint/Amended Complaint
Darcie A. Tilly	4/16/2013	1.2	Fact and Legal Investigation and Drafting of Complaint/Amended Complaint
Darcie A. Tilly	4/18/2013	2.4	Fact and Legal Investigation and Drafting of Complaint/Amended Complaint
Darcie A. Tilly	4/19/2013	1.7	Fact and Legal Investigation and Drafting of Complaint/Amended Complaint
Darcie A. Tilly	4/22/2013	3.0	Fact and Legal Investigation and Drafting of Complaint/Amended Complaint
Darcie A. Tilly	4/23/2013	0.1	Fact and Legal Investigation and Drafting of Complaint/Amended Complaint
Darcie A. Tilly	4/24/2013	1.5	Fact and Legal Investigation and Drafting of Complaint/Amended Complaint
Darcie A. Tilly	4/25/2013	1.5	Fact and Legal Investigation and Drafting of Complaint/Amended Complaint
Darcie A. Tilly	4/30/2013	0.4	Fact and Legal Investigation and Drafting of Complaint/Amended Complaint
Darcie A. Tilly	5/1/2013	1.1	Fact and Legal Investigation and Drafting of Complaint/Amended Complaint
Darcie A. Tilly	5/2/2013	1.0	Fact and Legal Investigation and Drafting of Complaint/Amended Complaint
Darcie A. Tilly	5/3/2013	0.6	Fact and Legal Investigation and Drafting of Complaint/Amended Complaint
Darcie A. Tilly	5/7/2013	1.2	Fact and Legal Investigation and Drafting of Complaint/Amended Complaint
Darcie A. Tilly	5/8/2013	0.9	Case Administration (includes co-counsel conferences not otherwise classified)
Darcie A. Tilly	5/9/2013	1.2	Case Administration (includes co-counsel conferences not otherwise classified)
Darcie A. Tilly	5/14/2013	3.0	Fact and Legal Investigation and Drafting of Complaint/Amended Complaint
Darcie A. Tilly	5/16/2013	1.0	Fact and Legal Investigation and Drafting of Complaint/Amended Complaint
Darcie A. Tilly	5/19/2013	4.4	Fact and Legal Investigation and Drafting of Complaint/Amended Complaint
Darcie A. Tilly	5/20/2013	0.9	Fact and Legal Investigation and Drafting of Complaint/Amended Complaint
Darcie A. Tilly	5/21/2013	0.5	Fact and Legal Investigation and Drafting of Complaint/Amended Complaint
Darcie A. Tilly	5/22/2013	0.8	Fact and Legal Investigation and Drafting of Complaint/Amended Complaint
Darcie A. Tilly	5/22/2013	0.7	Fact and Legal Investigation and Drafting of Complaint/Amended Complaint
Darcie A. Tilly	5/23/2013	1.5	Fact and Legal Investigation and Drafting of Complaint/Amended Complaint
Darcie A. Tilly	5/24/2013	2.3	Fact and Legal Investigation and Drafting of Complaint/Amended Complaint

Timekeeper	Work Date	Hours	Task
Darcie A. Tilly	5/27/2013	0.5	Fact and Legal Investigation and Drafting of Complaint/Amended Complaint
Darcie A. Tilly	5/28/2013	3.9	Fact and Legal Investigation and Drafting of Complaint/Amended Complaint
Darcie A. Tilly	5/29/2013	1.0	Fact and Legal Investigation and Drafting of Complaint/Amended Complaint
Darcie A. Tilly	5/30/2013	1.3	Fact and Legal Investigation and Drafting of Complaint/Amended Complaint
Darcie A. Tilly	6/3/2013	4.5	Fact and Legal Investigation and Drafting of Complaint/Amended Complaint
Darcie A. Tilly	6/4/2013	2.8	Fact and Legal Investigation and Drafting of Complaint/Amended Complaint
Darcie A. Tilly	6/6/2013	0.8	Case Administration (includes co-counsel conferences not otherwise classified)
Darcie A. Tilly	6/11/2013	1.1	Case Administration (includes co-counsel conferences not otherwise classified)
Darcie A. Tilly	6/12/2013	1.5	Fact and Legal Investigation and Drafting of Complaint/Amended Complaint
Darcie A. Tilly	6/16/2013	0.3	Case Administration (includes co-counsel conferences not otherwise classified)
Darcie A. Tilly	6/19/2013	1.4	Locate and Communicate with Potential Class Members; Plaintiffs' Motion for Preliminary Injunction (other than Court hearing)
Darcie A. Tilly	6/20/2013	1.2	Opposing Defendants' Motion(s) to Dismiss (other than Court hearing)
Darcie A. Tilly	6/20/2013	1.0	Case Administration (includes co-counsel conferences not otherwise classified)
Darcie A. Tilly	6/20/2013	0.2	Opposing Defendants' Motion to Transfer Venue (other than Court hearing)
Darcie A. Tilly	6/20/2013	0.2	Prepare for Motion for Class Certification
Darcie A. Tilly	6/21/2013	0.9	Locate and Communicate with Potential Class Members
Darcie A. Tilly	6/21/2013	1.6	Opposing Defendants' Motion to Transfer Venue (other than Court hearing)
Darcie A. Tilly	6/24/2013	1.7	Opposing Defendants' Motion to Transfer Venue (other than Court hearing); Plaintiffs' Motion for Preliminary Injunction (other than Court hearing)
Darcie A. Tilly	6/25/2013	1.1	Case Administration (includes co-counsel conferences not otherwise classified)
Darcie A. Tilly	6/26/2013	0.8	Case Administration (includes co-counsel conferences not otherwise classified)
Darcie A. Tilly	6/27/2013	0.9	Opposing Defendants' Motion to Transfer Venue (other than Court hearing)
Darcie A. Tilly	6/27/2013	1.7	Case Administration (includes co-counsel conferences not otherwise classified)
Darcie A. Tilly	6/28/2013	2.2	Prepare for Motion for Class Certification
Darcie A. Tilly	6/28/2013	1.4	Plaintiffs' Motion for Preliminary Injunction (other than Court hearing)

Timekeeper	Work Date	Hours	Task
Darcie A. Tilly	7/1/2013	0.3	Opposing Defendants' Motion to Transfer Venue (other than Court hearing)
Darcie A. Tilly	7/3/2013	1.0	Case Administration (includes co-counsel conferences not otherwise classified)
Darcie A. Tilly	7/3/2013	0.3	Locate and Communicate with Potential Class Members
Darcie A. Tilly	7/8/2013	0.2	Communicate with Defendants Not Otherwise Classified (includes meet and confers regarding schedule)
Darcie A. Tilly	7/9/2013	1.6	Opposing Defendants' Motion to Transfer Venue (other than Court hearing)
Darcie A. Tilly	7/11/2013	1.1	Case Administration (includes co-counsel conferences not otherwise classified)
Darcie A. Tilly	7/12/2013	0.2	Communicate with Defendants Not Otherwise Classified (includes meet and confers regarding schedule)
Darcie A. Tilly	7/15/2013	0.3	Communicate with Defendants Not Otherwise Classified (includes meet and confers regarding schedule)
Darcie A. Tilly	7/18/2013	1.0	Case Administration (includes co-counsel conferences not otherwise classified)
Darcie A. Tilly	7/23/2013	0.3	Rule 26(f) Conference and Report to Court
Darcie A. Tilly	7/24/2013	3.0	Rule 26(f) Conference and Report to Court
Darcie A. Tilly	7/25/2013	1.0	Rule 26(f) Conference and Report to Court
Darcie A. Tilly	7/25/2013	1.1	Case Administration (includes co-counsel conferences not otherwise classified)
Darcie A. Tilly	7/25/2013	0.3	Negotiate and Draft Settlement Agreement
Darcie A. Tilly	7/26/2013	2.3	Communicate with Defendants Not Otherwise Classified (includes meet and confers regarding schedule)
Darcie A. Tilly	7/26/2013	1.0	Rule 26(f) Conference and Report to Court
Darcie A. Tilly	7/29/2013	0.8	Stipulated Protective Order (including Negotiations, Legal Research and Motion Practice)
Darcie A. Tilly	7/29/2013	0.6	Opposing Defendants' Motion to Transfer Venue (other than Court hearing)
Darcie A. Tilly	7/30/2013	0.3	Locate and Communicate with Potential Class Members
Darcie A. Tilly	7/30/2013	2.7	Opposing Defendants' Motion to Transfer Venue (other than Court hearing)
Darcie A. Tilly	7/31/2013	0.4	Communicate with Defendants Not Otherwise Classified (includes meet and confers regarding schedule)
Darcie A. Tilly	7/31/2013	2.2	Opposing Defendants' Motion to Transfer Venue (other than Court hearing)
Darcie A. Tilly	8/1/2013	1.2	Case Administration (includes co-counsel conferences not otherwise classified)
Darcie A. Tilly	8/6/2013	0.4	Opposing Defendants' Motion to Transfer Venue (other than Court hearing)

Timekeeper	Work Date	Hours	Task
Darcie A. Tilly	8/8/2013	0.8	Case Administration (includes co-counsel conferences not otherwise classified)
Darcie A. Tilly	8/8/2013	2.1	Opposing Defendants' Motion to Transfer Venue (other than Court hearing)
Darcie A. Tilly	8/9/2013	3.9	Opposing Defendants' Motion to Transfer Venue (other than Court hearing); Plaintiffs' Motion for Preliminary Injunction (other than Court hearing); Draft Written Discovery to Serve on Defendants (RFAs, RFPs, ROGs, Depo Notices); Locate and Communicate with Potential Class Members
Darcie A. Tilly	8/11/2013	0.9	Opposing Defendants' Motion to Transfer Venue (other than Court hearing)
Darcie A. Tilly	8/11/2013	1.4	Draft Written Discovery to Serve on Defendants (RFAs, RFPs, ROGs)
Darcie A. Tilly	8/12/2013	0.9	Draft Written Discovery to Serve on Defendants (RFAs, RFPs, ROGs)
Darcie A. Tilly	8/14/2013	7.2	Opposing Defendants' Motion to Transfer Venue (other than Court hearing)
Darcie A. Tilly	8/15/2013	11.5	Opposing Defendants' Motion to Transfer Venue (other than Court hearing)
Darcie A. Tilly	8/16/2013	3.7	Opposing Defendants' Motion to Transfer Venue (other than Court hearing)
Darcie A. Tilly	8/18/2013	0.4	Opposing Defendants' Motion to Transfer Venue (other than Court hearing)
Darcie A. Tilly	8/19/2013	0.9	Case Administration (includes co-counsel conferences not otherwise classified)
Darcie A. Tilly	8/19/2013	0.4	Opposing Defendants' Motion to Transfer Venue (other than Court hearing)
Darcie A. Tilly	8/20/2013	2.4	Opposing Defendants' Motion to Transfer Venue (other than Court hearing); Stipulated Protective Order (including Negotiations, Legal Research and Motion Practice); Rule 26(f) Conference and Report to Court
Darcie A. Tilly	8/21/2013	1.5	Draft Written Discovery to Serve on Defendants (RFAs, RFPs, ROGs)
Darcie A. Tilly	8/22/2013	1.5	Case Administration (includes co-counsel conferences not otherwise classified)
Darcie A. Tilly	8/22/2013	4.6	Opposing Defendants' Motion to Transfer Venue (other than Court hearing)
Darcie A. Tilly	8/22/2013	0.7	Draft Written Discovery to Serve on Defendants (RFAs, RFPs, ROGs)
Darcie A. Tilly	8/23/2013	2.8	Opposing Defendants' Motion to Transfer Venue (other than Court hearing)
Darcie A. Tilly	8/23/2013	0.3	Locate and Communicate with Potential Class Members
Darcie A. Tilly	8/26/2013	1.8	Rule 26(f) Conference and Report to Court
Darcie A. Tilly	8/27/2013	1.4	Rule 26(f) Conference and Report to Court

Timekeeper	Work Date	Hours	Task
Darcie A. Tilly	8/28/2013	2.6	Draft Written Discovery to Serve on Defendants (RFAs, RFPs, ROGs)
Darcie A. Tilly	8/28/2013	0.3	Opposing Defendants' Motion to Transfer Venue (other than Court hearing)
Darcie A. Tilly	8/28/2013	1.4	Rule 26(f) Conference and Report to Court
Darcie A. Tilly	8/29/2013	0.2	Opposing Defendants' Motion to Transfer Venue (other than Court hearing)
Darcie A. Tilly	8/30/2013	4.6	Opposing Defendants' Motion to Transfer Venue (other than Court hearing)
Darcie A. Tilly	9/3/2013	0.3	Collect, Review and Produce Documents Requested by Defendants
Darcie A. Tilly	9/4/2013	2.2	Collect, Review and Produce Documents Requested by Defendants
Darcie A. Tilly	9/5/2013	0.6	Case Administration (includes co-counsel conferences not otherwise classified)
Darcie A. Tilly	9/5/2013	0.2	Stipulated Protective Order (including Negotiations, Legal Research and Motion Practice)
Darcie A. Tilly	9/6/2013	3.6	Rule 26(f) Conference and Report to Court
Darcie A. Tilly	9/9/2013	1.4	Communicate with Defendants Not Otherwise Classified (includes meet and confers regarding schedule)
Darcie A. Tilly	9/12/2013	1.1	Case Administration (includes co-counsel conferences not otherwise classified)
Darcie A. Tilly	9/13/2013	4.1	Rule 26(f) Conference and Report to Court
Darcie A. Tilly	9/16/2013	0.1	Initial Disclosures
Darcie A. Tilly	9/17/2013	0.9	Initial Disclosures
Darcie A. Tilly	9/18/2013	1.0	Hearing on Motion to Transfer Venue and Rule 16(b) Status Conference
Darcie A. Tilly	9/19/2013	0.9	Case Administration (includes co-counsel conferences not otherwise classified)
Darcie A. Tilly	9/19/2013	1.4	Rule 26(f) Conference and Report to Court
Darcie A. Tilly	9/20/2013	3.8	Rule 26(f) Conference and Report to Court
Darcie A. Tilly	9/22/2013	6.4	Hearing on Motion to Transfer Venue and Rule 16(b) Status Conference
Darcie A. Tilly	9/23/2013	2.6	Prepare for Motion for Class Certification
Darcie A. Tilly	9/23/2013	6.7	Hearing on Motion to Transfer Venue and Rule 16(b) Status Conference
Darcie A. Tilly	9/24/2013	1.1	Fact and Legal Investigation and Drafting of Complaint/Amended Complaint
Darcie A. Tilly	9/25/2013	0.6	Fact and Legal Investigation and Drafting of Complaint/Amended Complaint
Darcie A. Tilly	9/26/2013	1.4	Fact and Legal Investigation and Drafting of Complaint/Amended Complaint
Darcie A. Tilly	9/29/2013	0.7	Fact and Legal Investigation and Drafting of Complaint/Amended Complaint
Darcie A. Tilly	9/30/2013	1.0	Fact and Legal Investigation and Drafting of Complaint/Amended Complaint

Timekeeper	Work Date	Hours	Task
Darcie A. Tilly	10/1/2013	1.9	Fact and Legal Investigation and Drafting of Complaint/Amended Complaint
Darcie A. Tilly	10/2/2013	1.9	Fact and Legal Investigation and Drafting of Complaint/Amended Complaint
Darcie A. Tilly	10/3/2013	0.6	Communicate with Defendants Not Otherwise Classified (includes meet and confers regarding schedule)
Darcie A. Tilly	10/4/2013	0.4	Draft Written Discovery to Serve on Defendants (RFAs, RFPs, ROGs)
Darcie A. Tilly	10/4/2013	0.2	Fact and Legal Investigation and Drafting of Complaint/Amended Complaint
Darcie A. Tilly	10/7/2013	2.2	Draft Written Discovery to Serve on Defendants (RFAs, RFPs, ROGs, Depo Notices); Communicate with Defendants Not Otherwise Classified (includes meet and confers regarding schedule); Case Administration (includes co-counsel conferences not otherwise classified)
Darcie A. Tilly	10/8/2013	1.3	Communicate with Defendants Not Otherwise Classified (includes meet and confers regarding schedule)
Darcie A. Tilly	10/9/2013	0.1	Case Administration (includes co-counsel conferences not otherwise classified)
Darcie A. Tilly	10/10/2013	2.3	Plaintiffs' Motion for Preliminary Injunction (other than Court hearing); Case Administration (includes co-counsel conferences not otherwise classified)
Darcie A. Tilly	10/11/2013	1.8	Communicate with Defendants Not Otherwise Classified (includes meet and confers regarding schedule)
Darcie A. Tilly	10/17/2013	1.4	Prepare for Motion for Class Certification
Darcie A. Tilly	10/17/2013	0.4	Case Administration (includes co-counsel conferences not otherwise classified)
Darcie A. Tilly	10/18/2013	0.3	Plaintiffs' Motion for Preliminary Injunction (other than Court hearing)
Darcie A. Tilly	10/18/2013	0.8	Prepare for Motion for Class Certification
Darcie A. Tilly	10/20/2013	0.4	Prepare for Motion for Class Certification
Darcie A. Tilly	10/21/2013	0.2	Other Discovery (intial disclosures, third party discovery, etc.)
Darcie A. Tilly	10/21/2013	5.3	Prepare for Motion for Class Certification
Darcie A. Tilly	10/22/2013	0.5	Plaintiffs' Motion for Preliminary Injunction (other than Court hearing)
Darcie A. Tilly	10/23/2013	1.8	Communicate with Defendants Not Otherwise Classified (includes meet and confers regarding schedule)
Darcie A. Tilly	10/24/2013	1.3	Case Administration (includes co-counsel conferences not otherwise classified)
Darcie A. Tilly	10/25/2013	2.5	Plaintiffs' Motion for Preliminary Injunction (other than Court hearing)

Timekeeper	Work Date	Hours	Task
Darcie A. Tilly	10/26/2013	1.4	Plaintiffs' Motion for Preliminary Injunction (other than Court hearing)
Darcie A. Tilly	10/27/2013	0.1	Plaintiffs' Motion for Preliminary Injunction (other than Court hearing)
Darcie A. Tilly	10/28/2013	0.5	Plaintiffs' Motion for Preliminary Injunction (other than Court hearing)
Darcie A. Tilly	10/29/2013	1.4	Plaintiffs' Motion for Preliminary Injunction (other than Court hearing)
Darcie A. Tilly	10/30/2013	0.1	Communicate with Defendants Not Otherwise Classified (includes meet and confers regarding schedule)
Darcie A. Tilly	10/30/2013	1.5	Plaintiffs' Motion for Preliminary Injunction (other than Court hearing)
Darcie A. Tilly	10/31/2013	0.5	Hearing: Motion for Preliminary Injunction and Motion to Dismiss
Darcie A. Tilly	10/31/2013	1.9	Plaintiffs' Motion for Preliminary Injunction (other than Court hearing)
Darcie A. Tilly	11/1/2013	1.1	Plaintiffs' Motion for Preliminary Injunction (other than Court hearing)
Darcie A. Tilly	11/2/2013	5.7	Plaintiffs' Motion for Preliminary Injunction (other than Court hearing)
Darcie A. Tilly	11/3/2013	10.4	Plaintiffs' Motion for Preliminary Injunction (other than Court hearing)
Darcie A. Tilly	11/4/2013	9.5	Plaintiffs' Motion for Preliminary Injunction (other than Court hearing)
Darcie A. Tilly	11/5/2013	1.5	Plaintiffs' Motion for Preliminary Injunction (other than Court hearing)
Darcie A. Tilly	11/6/2013	1.0	Opposing Defendants' Motion(s) to Dismiss (other than Court hearing)
Darcie A. Tilly	11/7/2013	1.1	Opposing Defendants' Motion(s) to Dismiss (other than Court hearing)
Darcie A. Tilly	11/8/2013	1.5	Opposing Defendants' Motion(s) to Dismiss (other than Court hearing)
Darcie A. Tilly	11/11/2013	1.2	Opposing Defendants' Motion(s) to Dismiss (other than Court hearing)
Darcie A. Tilly	11/12/2013	4.9	Opposing Defendants' Motion(s) to Dismiss (other than Court hearing)
Darcie A. Tilly	11/13/2013	11.0	Opposing Defendants' Motion(s) to Dismiss (other than Court hearing)
Darcie A. Tilly	11/14/2013	1.1	Opposing Defendants' Motion(s) to Dismiss (other than Court hearing)
Darcie A. Tilly	11/14/2013	4.1	Opposing Defendants' Motion(s) to Dismiss (other than Court hearing)
Darcie A. Tilly	11/15/2013	0.1	Case Administration (includes co-counsel conferences not otherwise classified)
Darcie A. Tilly	11/18/2013	0.2	Case Administration (includes co-counsel conferences not otherwise classified)
Darcie A. Tilly	11/18/2013	2.4	Prepare for Motion for Class Certification

Timekeeper	Work Date	Hours	Task
Darcie A. Tilly	11/20/2013	0.4	Plaintiffs' Motion for Preliminary Injunction (other than Court hearing)
Darcie A. Tilly	11/20/2013	2.6	Prepare for Motion for Class Certification
Darcie A. Tilly	11/21/2013	1.4	Case Administration (includes co-counsel conferences not otherwise classified)
Darcie A. Tilly	11/22/2013	0.4	Plaintiffs' Motion for Preliminary Injunction (other than Court hearing)
Darcie A. Tilly	11/22/2013	1.4	Prepare for Motion for Class Certification
Darcie A. Tilly	11/25/2013	0.1	Plaintiffs' Motion for Preliminary Injunction (other than Court hearing)
Darcie A. Tilly	11/27/2013	0.2	Plaintiffs' Motion for Preliminary Injunction (other than Court hearing)
Darcie A. Tilly	11/28/2013	5.4	Plaintiffs' Motion for Preliminary Injunction (other than Court hearing)
Darcie A. Tilly	11/29/2013	6.1	Plaintiffs' Motion for Preliminary Injunction (other than Court hearing)
Darcie A. Tilly	11/30/2013	0.6	Plaintiffs' Motion for Preliminary Injunction (other than Court hearing)
Darcie A. Tilly	11/30/2013	2.2	Rule 26(f) Conference and Report to Court
Darcie A. Tilly	11/30/2013	2.2	Prepare for Motion for Class Certification
Darcie A. Tilly	12/3/2013	2.4	Rule 26(f) Conference and Report to Court
Darcie A. Tilly	12/4/2013	0.3	Rule 26(f) Conference and Report to Court
Darcie A. Tilly	12/5/2013	0.8	Hearing: Motion for Preliminary Injunction and Motion to Dismiss
Darcie A. Tilly	12/6/2013	2.8	Hearing: Motion for Preliminary Injunction and Motion to Dismiss
Darcie A. Tilly	12/8/2013	1.2	Hearing: Motion for Preliminary Injunction and Motion to Dismiss
Darcie A. Tilly	12/9/2013	9.3	Hearing: Motion for Preliminary Injunction and Motion to Dismiss
Darcie A. Tilly	12/9/2013	0.7	Discovery Disputes (not stipulated PO issue)
Darcie A. Tilly	12/10/2013	2.1	Plaintiffs' Motion for Preliminary Injunction (other than Court hearing)
Darcie A. Tilly	12/11/2013	2.1	Stipulated Protective Order (including Negotiations, Legal Research and Motion Practice)
Darcie A. Tilly	12/11/2013	1.6	Plaintiffs' Motion for Preliminary Injunction (other than Court hearing)
Darcie A. Tilly	12/12/2013	0.9	Draft Written Discovery to Serve on Defendants (RFAs, RFPs, ROGs)
Darcie A. Tilly	12/12/2013	0.7	Plaintiffs' Motion for Preliminary Injunction (other than Court hearing)
Darcie A. Tilly	12/13/2013	0.2	Draft Written Discovery to Serve on Defendants (RFAs, RFPs, ROGs, Depo Notices)
Darcie A. Tilly	12/15/2013	0.1	Stipulated Protective Order (including Negotiations, Legal Research and Motion Practice)
Darcie A. Tilly	12/16/2013	2.1	Discovery Disputes (not stipulated PO issue)

Timekeeper	Work Date	Hours	Task
Darcie A. Tilly	12/17/2013	0.4	Communicate with Defendants Not Otherwise Classified (includes meet and confers regarding schedule)
Darcie A. Tilly	12/19/2013	0.6	Prepare for Motion for Class Certification
Darcie A. Tilly	12/19/2013	0.2	Stipulated Protective Order (including Negotiations, Legal Research and Motion Practice)
Darcie A. Tilly	12/20/2013	1.2	Stipulated Protective Order (including Negotiations, Legal Research and Motion Practice); Communicate with Defendants Not Otherwise Classified (includes meet and confers regarding schedule)
Darcie A. Tilly	12/22/2013	0.8	Stipulated Protective Order (including Negotiations, Legal Research and Motion Practice)
Darcie A. Tilly	12/23/2013	1.8	Stipulated Protective Order (including Negotiations, Legal Research and Motion Practice)
Darcie A. Tilly	12/24/2013	1.0	Stipulated Protective Order (including Negotiations, Legal Research and Motion Practice)
Darcie A. Tilly	12/27/2013	0.8	Stipulated Protective Order (including Negotiations, Legal Research and Motion Practice)
Darcie A. Tilly	12/29/2013	0.4	Discovery Disputes (not stipulated PO issue)
Darcie A. Tilly	12/30/2013	0.4	Case Administration (includes co-counsel conferences not otherwise classified)
Darcie A. Tilly	12/31/2013	0.5	Discovery Disputes (not stipulated PO issue)
Darcie A. Tilly	1/2/2014	1.0	Case Administration (includes co-counsel conferences not otherwise classified)
Darcie A. Tilly	1/2/2014	0.5	Prepare for Motion for Class Certification
Darcie A. Tilly	1/3/2014	1.3	Discovery Disputes (not stipulated PO issue)
Darcie A. Tilly	1/3/2014	0.2	Stipulated Protective Order (including Negotiations, Legal Research and Motion Practice)
Darcie A. Tilly	1/5/2014	1.7	Stipulated Protective Order (including Negotiations, Legal Research and Motion Practice)
Darcie A. Tilly	1/6/2014	4.3	Stipulated Protective Order (including Negotiations, Legal Research and Motion Practice); Discovery Disputes (not stipulated PO issue)
Darcie A. Tilly	1/7/2014	1.4	Stipulated Protective Order (including Negotiations, Legal Research and Motion Practice); Discovery Disputes (not stipulated PO issue)

Timekeeper	Work Date	Hours	Task
Darcie A. Tilly	1/8/2014	0.4	Discovery Disputes (not stipulated PO issue); Communicate with Defendants Not Otherwise Classified (includes meet and confers regarding schedule)
Darcie A. Tilly	1/9/2014	0.6	Discovery Disputes (not stipulated PO issue)
Darcie A. Tilly	1/9/2014	1.0	Case Administration (includes co-counsel conferences not otherwise classified)
Darcie A. Tilly	1/10/2014	0.5	Communicate with Defendants Not Otherwise Classified (includes meet and confers regarding schedule)
Darcie A. Tilly	1/14/2014	0.2	Stipulated Protective Order (including Negotiations, Legal Research and Motion Practice)
Darcie A. Tilly	1/15/2014	0.2	Case Administration (includes co-counsel conferences not otherwise classified)
Darcie A. Tilly	1/16/2014	0.5	Prepare for Motion for Class Certification
Darcie A. Tilly	1/16/2014	1.0	Case Administration (includes co-counsel conferences not otherwise classified)
Darcie A. Tilly	1/17/2014	0.7	Communicate with Defendants Not Otherwise Classified (includes meet and confers regarding schedule)
Darcie A. Tilly	1/20/2014	5.6	Stipulated Protective Order (including Negotiations, Legal Research and Motion Practice)
Darcie A. Tilly	1/21/2014	2.3	Stipulated Protective Order (including Negotiations, Legal Research and Motion Practice)
Darcie A. Tilly	1/22/2014	0.9	Communicate with Defendants Not Otherwise Classified (includes meet and confers regarding schedule)
Darcie A. Tilly	1/22/2014	0.8	Case Administration (includes co-counsel conferences not otherwise classified)
Darcie A. Tilly	1/23/2014	0.6	Communicate with Defendants Not Otherwise Classified (includes meet and confers regarding schedule)
Darcie A. Tilly	1/23/2014	1.2	Case Administration (includes co-counsel conferences not otherwise classified)
Darcie A. Tilly	1/24/2014	0.6	Depositions by Plaintiffs (includes prep and digests); Discovery Disputes (not stipulated PO issue)
Darcie A. Tilly	1/25/2014	0.2	Depositions by Plaintiffs (includes prep and digests)
Darcie A. Tilly	1/26/2014	0.3	Discovery Disputes (not stipulated PO issue)
Darcie A. Tilly	1/26/2014	0.7	Prepare for Motion for Class Certification
Darcie A. Tilly	1/26/2014	0.7	Depositions by Plaintiffs (includes prep and digests)
Darcie A. Tilly	1/27/2014	0.3	Depositions by Plaintiffs (includes prep and digests)
Darcie A. Tilly	1/28/2014	2.1	Discovery Disputes (not stipulated PO issue)

Timekeeper	Work Date	Hours	Task
Darcie A. Tilly	1/29/2014	1.0	Prepare for Motion for Class Certification
Darcie A. Tilly	1/30/2014	0.4	Depositions by Plaintiffs (includes prep and digests)
Darcie A. Tilly	1/31/2014	8.1	Depositions by Plaintiffs (includes prep and digests)
Darcie A. Tilly	1/31/2014	4.2	Depositions by Plaintiffs (includes prep and digests)
Darcie A. Tilly	2/3/2014	0.1	Communicate with Defendants Not Otherwise Classified (includes meet and confers regarding schedule)
Darcie A. Tilly	2/4/2014	0.4	Expert Witnesses
Darcie A. Tilly	2/5/2014	0.1	Negotiate and Draft Settlement Agreement
Darcie A. Tilly	2/6/2014	1.0	Case Administration (includes co-counsel conferences not otherwise classified)
Darcie A. Tilly	2/6/2014	1.6	Discovery Disputes (not stipulated PO issue)
Darcie A. Tilly	2/6/2014	1.8	Discovery Disputes (not stipulated PO issue)
Darcie A. Tilly	2/6/2014	0.5	Depositions by Plaintiffs (includes prep and digests)
Darcie A. Tilly	2/7/2014	0.3	Discovery Disputes (not stipulated PO issue)
Darcie A. Tilly	2/7/2014	1.5	Prepare for Motion for Class Certification
Darcie A. Tilly	2/7/2014	1.0	Discovery Disputes (not stipulated PO issue)
Darcie A. Tilly	2/8/2014	0.9	Discovery Disputes (not stipulated PO issue)
Darcie A. Tilly	2/9/2014	0.4	Prepare for Motion for Class Certification
Darcie A. Tilly	2/10/2014	0.8	Communicate with Defendants Not Otherwise Classified (includes meet and confers regarding schedule); Negotiate and Draft Settlement Agreement
Darcie A. Tilly	2/11/2014	0.6	Expert Witnesses
Darcie A. Tilly	2/11/2014	2.9	Stipulated Protective Order (including Negotiations, Legal Research and Motion Practice); Depositions by Defendants (includes prep); Collect, Review and Produce Documents Requested by Defendants
Darcie A. Tilly	2/12/2014	2.2	Stipulated Protective Order (including Negotiations, Legal Research and Motion Practice)
Darcie A. Tilly	2/13/2014	0.9	Prepare for Motion for Class Certification
Darcie A. Tilly	2/14/2014	0.4	Prepare for Motion for Class Certification
Darcie A. Tilly	2/17/2014	0.3	Collect, Review and Produce Documents Requested by Defendants
Darcie A. Tilly	2/17/2014	0.6	Respond to Written Discovery Served by Defendants (RFPs, RFA, ROGs)
Darcie A. Tilly	2/18/2014	1.2	Prepare for Motion for Class Certification
Darcie A. Tilly	2/19/2014	1.5	Negotiate and Draft Settlement Agreement
Darcie A. Tilly	2/20/2014	0.1	Stipulated Protective Order (including Negotiations, Legal Research and Motion Practice)
Darcie A. Tilly	2/20/2014	0.2	Negotiate and Draft Settlement Agreement
Darcie A. Tilly	2/20/2014	0.5	Depositions by Defendants (includes prep)

Timekeeper	Work Date	Hours	Task
Darcie A. Tilly	2/21/2014	0.3	Case Administration (includes co-counsel conferences not otherwise classified)
Darcie A. Tilly	2/23/2014	0.1	Negotiate and Draft Settlement Agreement
Darcie A. Tilly	2/24/2014	0.1	Stipulated Protective Order (including Negotiations, Legal Research and Motion Practice)
Darcie A. Tilly	2/24/2014	0.2	Prepare for Motion for Class Certification
Darcie A. Tilly	2/24/2014	0.8	Respond to Written Discovery Served by Defendants (RFPs, RFA, ROGs)
Darcie A. Tilly	2/24/2014	0.2	Depositions by Defendants (includes prep)
Darcie A. Tilly	2/25/2014	0.4	Expert Witnesses
Darcie A. Tilly	2/25/2014	0.4	Collect, Review and Produce Documents Requested by Defendants
Darcie A. Tilly	2/26/2014	1.3	Respond to Written Discovery Served by Defendants (RFPs, RFA, ROGs)
Darcie A. Tilly	2/27/2014	3.4	Respond to Written Discovery Served by Defendants (RFPs, RFA, ROGs)
Darcie A. Tilly	2/28/2014	4.0	Respond to Written Discovery Served by Defendants (RFPs, RFA, ROGs)
Darcie A. Tilly	3/1/2014	1.4	Respond to Written Discovery Served by Defendants (RFPs, RFA, ROGs)
Darcie A. Tilly	3/2/2014	4.2	Respond to Written Discovery Served by Defendants (RFPs, RFA, ROGs)
Darcie A. Tilly	3/3/2014	1.9	Respond to Written Discovery Served by Defendants (RFPs, RFA, ROGs)
Darcie A. Tilly	3/4/2014	0.6	Respond to Written Discovery Served by Defendants (RFPs, RFA, ROGs)
Darcie A. Tilly	3/5/2014	7.6	Collect, Review and Produce Documents Requested by Defendants; Respond to Written Discovery Served by Defendants (RFPs, RFA, ROGs, Depo Notices); Case Administration (includes co-counsel conferences not otherwise classified)
Darcie A. Tilly	3/6/2014	6.0	Collect, Review and Produce Documents Requested by Defendants; Respond to Written Discovery Served by Defendants (RFPs, RFA, ROGs, Depo Notices)
Darcie A. Tilly	3/7/2014	2.0	Depositions by Defendants (includes prep); Collect, Review and Produce Documents Requested by Defendants; Negotiate and Draft Settlement Agreement
Darcie A. Tilly	3/9/2014	1.7	Respond to Written Discovery Served by Defendants (RFPs, RFA, ROGs, Depo Notices); Draft Written Discovery to Serve on Defendants (RFAs, RFPs, ROGs, Depo Notices)

Timekeeper	Work Date	Hours	Task
Darcie A. Tilly	3/10/2014	4.4	Collect, Review and Produce Documents Requested by Defendants; Respond to Written Discovery Served by Defendants (RFPs, RFA, ROGs, Depo Notices)
Darcie A. Tilly	3/11/2014	3.4	Collect, Review and Produce Documents Requested by Defendants; Respond to Written Discovery Served by Defendants (RFPs, RFA, ROGs, Depo Notices)
Darcie A. Tilly	3/12/2014	3.7	Collect, Review and Produce Documents Requested by Defendants
Darcie A. Tilly	3/13/2014	1.2	Case Administration (includes co-counsel conferences not otherwise classified)
Darcie A. Tilly	3/13/2014	0.5	Prepare for Motion for Class Certification
Darcie A. Tilly	3/13/2014	0.3	Depositions by Defendants (includes prep)
Darcie A. Tilly	3/14/2014	2.5	Collect, Review and Produce Documents Requested by Defendants
Darcie A. Tilly	3/15/2014	0.2	Stipulated Protective Order (including Negotiations, Legal Research and Motion Practice)
Darcie A. Tilly	3/15/2014	0.2	Respond to Written Discovery Served by Defendants (RFPs, RFA, ROGs)
Darcie A. Tilly	3/16/2014	0.9	Depositions by Defendants (includes prep)
Darcie A. Tilly	3/17/2014	1.1	Stipulated Protective Order (including Negotiations, Legal Research and Motion Practice); Collect, Review and Produce Documents Requested by Defendants
Darcie A. Tilly	3/18/2014	4.1	Draft Written Discovery to Serve on Defendants (RFAs, RFPs, ROGs, Depo Notices); Collect, Review and Produce Documents Requested by Defendants
Darcie A. Tilly	3/19/2014	4.5	Draft Written Discovery to Serve on Defendants (RFAs, RFPs, ROGs, Depo Notices); Collect, Review and Produce Documents Requested by Defendants
Darcie A. Tilly	3/20/2014	1.7	Negotiate and Draft Settlement Agreement
Darcie A. Tilly	3/21/2014	0.2	Negotiate and Draft Settlement Agreement
Darcie A. Tilly	3/23/2014	4.0	Negotiate and Draft Settlement Agreement
Darcie A. Tilly	3/24/2014	1.0	Negotiate and Draft Settlement Agreement
Darcie A. Tilly	3/24/2014	1.5	Discovery Disputes (not stipulated PO issue)
Darcie A. Tilly	3/24/2014	4.1	Collect, Review and Produce Documents Requested by Defendants
Darcie A. Tilly	3/25/2014	3.8	Collect, Review and Produce Documents Requested by Defendants; Stipulated Protective Order (including Negotiations, Legal Research and Motion Practice); Discovery Disputes (not stipulated PO issue); Negotiate and Draft Settlement Agreement
Darcie A. Tilly	3/26/2014	0.5	Negotiate and Draft Settlement Agreement

Timekeeper	Work Date	Hours	Task
Darcie A. Tilly	3/27/2014	11.1	Collect, Review and Produce Documents Requested by Defendants
Darcie A. Tilly	3/28/2014	9.5	Stipulated Protective Order (including Negotiations, Legal Research and Motion Practice)
Darcie A. Tilly	3/29/2014	0.5	Depositions by Defendants (includes prep)
Darcie A. Tilly	3/30/2014	0.2	Depositions by Defendants (includes prep)
Darcie A. Tilly	3/31/2014	2.2	Collect, Review and Produce Documents Requested by Defendants
Darcie A. Tilly	3/31/2014	0.8	Negotiate and Draft Settlement Agreement
Darcie A. Tilly	3/31/2014	0.6	Expert Witnesses
Darcie A. Tilly	4/1/2014	2.9	Negotiate and Draft Settlement Agreement; Discovery Disputes (not stipulated PO issue); Collect, Review and Produce Documents Requested by Defendants; Depositions by Defendants (includes prep)
Darcie A. Tilly	4/2/2014	3.8	Collect, Review and Produce Documents Requested by Defendants; Depositions by Defendants (includes prep)
Darcie A. Tilly	4/2/2014	0.8	Negotiate and Draft Settlement Agreement
Darcie A. Tilly	4/3/2014	13.0	Depositions by Defendants (includes prep)
Darcie A. Tilly	4/3/2014	1.4	Case Administration (includes co-counsel conferences not otherwise classified)
Darcie A. Tilly	4/4/2014	1.3	Negotiate and Draft Settlement Agreement; Collect, Review and Produce Documents Requested by Defendants
Darcie A. Tilly	4/6/2014	0.9	Depositions by Plaintiffs (includes prep and digests)
Darcie A. Tilly	4/7/2014	1.6	Negotiate and Draft Settlement Agreement; Discovery Disputes (not stipulated PO issue); Collect, Review and Produce Documents Requested by Defendants
Darcie A. Tilly	4/7/2014	0.4	Depositions by Plaintiffs (includes prep and digests)
Darcie A. Tilly	4/8/2014	6.9	Negotiate and Draft Settlement Agreement; Discovery Disputes (not stipulated PO issue); Collect, Review and Produce Documents Requested by Defendants
Darcie A. Tilly	4/9/2014	6.8	Negotiate and Draft Settlement Agreement
Darcie A. Tilly	4/10/2014	12.7	Negotiate and Draft Settlement Agreement
Darcie A. Tilly	4/11/2014	0.8	Negotiate and Draft Settlement Agreement
Darcie A. Tilly	4/12/2014	0.6	Negotiate and Draft Settlement Agreement
Darcie A. Tilly	4/13/2014	0.7	Negotiate and Draft Settlement Agreement
Darcie A. Tilly	4/14/2014	2.1	Negotiate and Draft Settlement Agreement
Darcie A. Tilly	4/15/2014	1.0	Negotiate and Draft Settlement Agreement
Darcie A. Tilly	4/16/2014	6.4	Negotiate and Draft Settlement Agreement
Darcie A. Tilly	4/17/2014	5.6	Negotiate and Draft Settlement Agreement
Darcie A. Tilly	4/18/2014	1.3	Negotiate and Draft Settlement Agreement
Darcie A. Tilly	4/21/2014	1.9	Negotiate and Draft Settlement Agreement

Timekeeper	Work Date	Hours	Task
Darcie A. Tilly	4/22/2014	1.7	Negotiate and Draft Settlement Agreement
Darcie A. Tilly	4/24/2014	4.4	Negotiate and Draft Settlement Agreement
Darcie A. Tilly	4/25/2014	11.5	Negotiate and Draft Settlement Agreement
Darcie A. Tilly	4/28/2014	5.3	Negotiate and Draft Settlement Agreement
Darcie A. Tilly	4/29/2014	1.2	Negotiate and Draft Settlement Agreement
Darcie A. Tilly	5/1/2014	3.5	Negotiate and Draft Settlement Agreement
Darcie A. Tilly	5/2/2014	0.3	Negotiate and Draft Settlement Agreement
Darcie A. Tilly	5/5/2014	0.1	Case Administration (includes co-counsel conferences not otherwise classified)
Darcie A. Tilly	5/7/2014	0.4	Negotiate and Draft Settlement Agreement
Darcie A. Tilly	5/8/2014	2.0	Negotiate and Draft Settlement Agreement
Darcie A. Tilly	5/9/2014	2.4	Negotiate and Draft Settlement Agreement
Darcie A. Tilly	5/12/2014	1.8	Negotiate and Draft Settlement Agreement
Darcie A. Tilly	5/13/2014	1.8	Negotiate and Draft Settlement Agreement
Darcie A. Tilly	5/14/2014	1.0	Negotiate and Draft Settlement Agreement
Darcie A. Tilly	5/15/2014	0.3	Negotiate and Draft Settlement Agreement
Darcie A. Tilly	5/16/2014	0.9	Negotiate and Draft Settlement Agreement
Darcie A. Tilly	5/19/2014	3.8	Negotiate and Draft Settlement Agreement
Darcie A. Tilly	5/20/2014	0.2	Negotiate and Draft Settlement Agreement
Darcie A. Tilly	5/21/2014	0.2	Negotiate and Draft Settlement Agreement
Darcie A. Tilly	5/22/2014	9.2	Negotiate and Draft Settlement Agreement
Darcie A. Tilly	5/23/2014	8.9	Negotiate and Draft Settlement Agreement
Darcie A. Tilly	5/24/2014	0.4	Negotiate and Draft Settlement Agreement
Darcie A. Tilly	5/25/2014	0.3	Negotiate and Draft Settlement Agreement
Darcie A. Tilly	5/29/2014	0.3	Negotiate and Draft Settlement Agreement
Darcie A. Tilly	5/30/2014	0.6	Negotiate and Draft Settlement Agreement
Darcie A. Tilly	5/31/2014	2.6	Negotiate and Draft Settlement Agreement
Darcie A. Tilly	6/1/2014	0.2	Negotiate and Draft Settlement Agreement
Darcie A. Tilly	6/2/2014	4.9	Negotiate and Draft Settlement Agreement
Darcie A. Tilly	6/3/2014	2.4	Negotiate and Draft Settlement Agreement
Darcie A. Tilly	6/4/2014	3.0	Negotiate and Draft Settlement Agreement
Darcie A. Tilly	6/6/2014	0.2	Negotiate and Draft Settlement Agreement
Darcie A. Tilly	6/8/2014	0.2	Negotiate and Draft Settlement Agreement
Darcie A. Tilly	6/9/2014	1.9	Negotiate and Draft Settlement Agreement
Darcie A. Tilly	6/10/2014	0.8	Negotiate and Draft Settlement Agreement
Darcie A. Tilly	6/11/2014	0.3	Negotiate and Draft Settlement Agreement
Darcie A. Tilly	6/11/2014	0.2	Negotiate and Draft Settlement Agreement
Darcie A. Tilly	6/12/2014	0.9	Negotiate and Draft Settlement Agreement
Darcie A. Tilly	6/13/2014	0.5	Negotiate and Draft Settlement Agreement
Darcie A. Tilly	6/16/2014	1.5	Negotiate and Draft Settlement Agreement
Darcie A. Tilly	6/17/2014	4.5	Negotiate and Draft Settlement Agreement
Darcie A. Tilly	6/18/2014	0.9	Negotiate and Draft Settlement Agreement
Darcie A. Tilly	6/19/2014	0.7	Negotiate and Draft Settlement Agreement
Darcie A. Tilly	6/20/2014	0.2	Negotiate and Draft Settlement Agreement
Darcie A. Tilly	6/22/2014	0.1	Negotiate and Draft Settlement Agreement
Darcie A. Tilly	6/23/2014	0.3	Negotiate and Draft Settlement Agreement
Darcie A. Tilly	6/24/2014	0.2	Negotiate and Draft Settlement Agreement
Darcie A. Tilly	6/25/2014	0.9	Negotiate and Draft Settlement Agreement
Darcie A. Tilly	6/26/2014	3.6	Negotiate and Draft Settlement Agreement

Timekeeper	Work Date	Hours	Task
Darcie A. Tilly	6/27/2014	0.2	Negotiate and Draft Settlement Agreement
Darcie A. Tilly	6/29/2014	0.4	Negotiate and Draft Settlement Agreement
Darcie A. Tilly	6/30/2014	1.2	Negotiate and Draft Settlement Agreement
Darcie A. Tilly	7/2/2014	0.1	Negotiate and Draft Settlement Agreement
Darcie A. Tilly	7/7/2014	1.5	Negotiate and Draft Settlement Agreement
Darcie A. Tilly	7/8/2014	1.2	Negotiate and Draft Settlement Agreement
Darcie A. Tilly	7/9/2014	0.3	Negotiate and Draft Settlement Agreement
Darcie A. Tilly	7/10/2014	2.2	Negotiate and Draft Settlement Agreement
Darcie A. Tilly	7/11/2014	0.7	Negotiate and Draft Settlement Agreement
Darcie A. Tilly	7/14/2014	1.5	Negotiate and Draft Settlement Agreement
Darcie A. Tilly	7/15/2014	0.8	Negotiate and Draft Settlement Agreement
Darcie A. Tilly	7/16/2014	0.8	Negotiate and Draft Settlement Agreement
Darcie A. Tilly	7/17/2014	2.3	Negotiate and Draft Settlement Agreement
Darcie A. Tilly	7/18/2014	0.3	Negotiate and Draft Settlement Agreement
Darcie A. Tilly	7/21/2014	0.2	Negotiate and Draft Settlement Agreement
Darcie A. Tilly	7/22/2014	2.2	Negotiate and Draft Settlement Agreement
Darcie A. Tilly	7/23/2014	3.5	Negotiate and Draft Settlement Agreement
Darcie A. Tilly	7/27/2014	5.2	Negotiate and Draft Settlement Agreement
Darcie A. Tilly	7/28/2014	0.4	Negotiate and Draft Settlement Agreement
Darcie A. Tilly	7/30/2014	0.1	Negotiate and Draft Settlement Agreement
Darcie A. Tilly	8/1/2014	0.9	Obtain Preliminary Approval of Class-Wide Portion of Settlement Agreement and Provisional Class Certification
Darcie A. Tilly	8/4/2014	0.7	Obtain Preliminary Approval of Class-Wide Portion of Settlement Agreement and Provisional Class Certification
Darcie A. Tilly	8/5/2014	2.0	Obtain Preliminary Approval of Class-Wide Portion of Settlement Agreement and Provisional Class Certification
Darcie A. Tilly	8/6/2014	1.2	Obtain Preliminary Approval of Class-Wide Portion of Settlement Agreement and Provisional Class Certification
Darcie A. Tilly	8/7/2014	0.9	Obtain Preliminary Approval of Class-Wide Portion of Settlement Agreement and Provisional Class Certification
Darcie A. Tilly	8/8/2014	0.1	Case Administration (includes co-counsel conferences not otherwise classified)
Darcie A. Tilly	8/11/2014	0.3	Obtain Preliminary Approval of Class-Wide Portion of Settlement Agreement and Provisional Class Certification
Darcie A. Tilly	8/12/2014	3.2	Obtain Preliminary Approval of Class-Wide Portion of Settlement Agreement and Provisional Class Certification
Darcie A. Tilly	8/13/2014	2.6	Obtain Preliminary Approval of Class-Wide Portion of Settlement Agreement and Provisional Class Certification; Obtain Approval of Settlement of Claims by Plaintiffs who Sued Via a Representative

Timekeeper	Work Date	Hours	Task
Darcie A. Tilly	8/14/2014	5.6	Obtain Preliminary Approval of Class-Wide Portion of Settlement Agreement and Provisional Class Certification; Obtain Approval of Settlement of Claims by Plaintiffs who Sued Via a Representative
Darcie A. Tilly	8/15/2014	3.3	Obtain Preliminary Approval of Class-Wide Portion of Settlement Agreement and Provisional Class Certification
Darcie A. Tilly	8/17/2014	0.5	Obtain Preliminary Approval of Class-Wide Portion of Settlement Agreement and Provisional Class Certification
Darcie A. Tilly	8/18/2014	8.9	Obtain Preliminary Approval of Class-Wide Portion of Settlement Agreement and Provisional Class Certification
Darcie A. Tilly	8/19/2014	0.2	Obtain Preliminary Approval of Class-Wide Portion of Settlement Agreement and Provisional Class Certification
Darcie A. Tilly	8/20/2014	0.1	Supervise Provision of Notice to Class
Darcie A. Tilly	8/21/2014	1.8	Locate and Communicate with Potential Class Members
Darcie A. Tilly	8/25/2014	1.6	Locate and Communicate with Potential Class Members
Darcie A. Tilly	8/26/2014	0.8	Locate and Communicate with Potential Class Members
Darcie A. Tilly	8/27/2014	1.1	Locate and Communicate with Potential Class Members
Darcie A. Tilly	8/28/2014	0.5	Supervise Provision of Notice to Class
Darcie A. Tilly	8/30/2014	0.5	Supervise Provision of Notice to Class
Darcie A. Tilly	8/31/2014	1.1	Supervise Provision of Notice to Class
Darcie A. Tilly	9/1/2014	0.3	Supervise Provision of Notice to Class
Darcie A. Tilly	9/2/2014	0.7	Supervise Provision of Notice to Class
Darcie A. Tilly	9/4/2014	1.2	Supervise Provision of Notice to Class
Darcie A. Tilly	9/8/2014	0.9	Supervise Provision of Notice to Class
Darcie A. Tilly	9/9/2014	0.4	Supervise Provision of Notice to Class
Darcie A. Tilly	9/10/2014	0.2	Supervise Provision of Notice to Class
Darcie A. Tilly	9/12/2014	0.5	Supervise Provision of Notice to Class
Darcie A. Tilly	9/15/2014	0.2	Supervise Provision of Notice to Class
Darcie A. Tilly	9/16/2014	0.9	Supervise Provision of Notice to Class
Darcie A. Tilly	9/17/2014	0.2	Supervise Provision of Notice to Class
Darcie A. Tilly	9/18/2014	1.1	Settlement Monitoring
Darcie A. Tilly	9/19/2014	1.2	Supervise Provision of Notice to Class
Darcie A. Tilly	9/22/2014	0.3	Supervise Provision of Notice to Class
Darcie A. Tilly	9/23/2014	1.0	Supervise Provision of Notice to Class
Darcie A. Tilly	9/24/2014	1.4	Supervise Provision of Notice to Class
Darcie A. Tilly	9/25/2014	0.4	Supervise Provision of Notice to Class
Darcie A. Tilly	9/26/2014	0.5	Supervise Provision of Notice to Class
Darcie A. Tilly	9/29/2014	0.2	Settlement Monitoring
Darcie A. Tilly	9/30/2014	0.6	Supervise Provision of Notice to Class
Darcie A. Tilly	10/1/2014	0.4	Supervise Provision of Notice to Class

Timekeeper	Work Date	Hours	Task
Darcie A. Tilly	10/3/2014	1.2	Supervise Provision of Notice to Class
Darcie A. Tilly	10/9/2014	1.0	Supervise Provision of Notice to Class
Darcie A. Tilly	10/10/2014	0.8	Supervise Provision of Notice to Class
Darcie A. Tilly	10/17/2014	0.2	Supervise Provision of Notice to Class
Darcie A. Tilly	10/21/2014	0.6	Attorneys Fees Motion
Darcie A. Tilly	10/24/2014	0.2	Attorneys Fees Motion
Darcie A. Tilly	10/30/2014	0.2	Attorneys Fees Motion
Darcie A. Tilly	10/31/2014	0.2	Supervise Provision of Notice to Class
Darcie A. Tilly	11/6/2014	0.4	Attorneys Fees Motion
Darcie A. Tilly	11/10/2014	0.4	Attorneys Fees Motion
Darcie A. Tilly	11/11/2014	0.1	Attorneys Fees Motion
Darcie A. Tilly	11/12/2014	0.3	Supervise Provision of Notice to Class
Darcie A. Tilly	11/13/2014	0.8	Case Administration (includes co-counsel conferences not otherwise classified)
Darcie A. Tilly	11/20/2014	0.2	Settlement Monitoring
Darcie A. Tilly	11/24/2014	0.9	Case Administration (includes co-counsel conferences not otherwise classified)
Darcie A. Tilly	11/25/2014	2.0	Attorneys Fees Motion
Darcie A. Tilly	11/26/2014	3.6	Attorneys Fees Motion
Darcie A. Tilly	11/28/2014	2.7	Attorneys Fees Motion
Darcie A. Tilly	11/28/2014	1.3	Attorneys Fees Motion
Darcie A. Tilly	11/29/2014	1.5	Attorneys Fees Motion
Darcie A. Tilly	11/29/2014	0.8	Attorneys Fees Motion
Darcie A. Tilly	11/30/2014	1.2	Attorneys Fees Motion
Darcie A. Tilly	11/30/2014	3.4	Attorneys Fees Motion
Total		835.2	

Timekeeper	Work Date	Hours	Task
Craig E. TenBroeck	1/6/2014	9.6	Stipulated Protective Order (including Negotiations, Legal Research and Motion Practice); Discovery Disputes (not stipulated PO issue)
Craig E. TenBroeck	1/16/2014	7.9	Prepare for Motion for Class Certification
Craig E. TenBroeck	1/17/2014	6.9	Prepare for Motion for Class Certification
Craig E. TenBroeck	1/19/2014	7.8	Prepare for Motion for Class Certification
Craig E. TenBroeck	1/21/2014	1	Prepare for Motion for Class Certification
Craig E. TenBroeck	2/6/2014	4.1	Depositions by Plaintiffs (includes prep)
Craig E. TenBroeck	2/20/2014	1.2	Stipulated Protective Order (including Negotiations, Legal Research and Motion Practice)
Craig E. TenBroeck	2/21/2014	3.6	Stipulated Protective Order (including Negotiations, Legal Research and Motion Practice)
Craig E. TenBroeck	2/27/2014	7.7	Respond to Written Discovery Served by Defendants (RFPs, RFA, ROGs)
Craig E. TenBroeck	2/28/2014	2.2	Respond to Written Discovery Served by Defendants (RFPs, RFA, ROGs)
Craig E. TenBroeck	4/2/2014	0.8	Prepare for Motion for Class Certification
Craig E. TenBroeck	4/3/2014	2.2	Prepare for Motion for Class Certification
Craig E. TenBroeck	4/4/2014	1.3	Prepare for Motion for Class Certification
Craig E. TenBroeck	4/6/2014	3.1	Prepare for Motion for Class Certification
Craig E. TenBroeck	4/7/2014	2.8	Prepare for Motion for Class Certification
Craig E. TenBroeck	4/8/2014	1.3	Prepare for Motion for Class Certification
Craig E. TenBroeck	4/9/2014	0.2	Prepare for Motion for Class Certification
Craig E. TenBroeck	4/18/2014	0.1	Prepare for Motion for Class Certification
Craig E. TenBroeck	4/22/2014	3.5	Prepare for Motion for Class Certification
Craig E. TenBroeck	6/20/2014	0.1	Locate and Communicate with Potential Class Members
Total		67.4	

Timekeeper	Work Date	Hours	Task
Blake M. Zollar	4/1/2014	2.5	Collect, Review and Produce Documents Requested
Blake M. Zollar	4/2/2014	2.6	Collect, Review and Produce Documents Requested
Blake M. Zollar	4/3/2014	0.3	Collect, Review and Produce Documents Requested
Blake M. Zollar	4/8/2014	4.5	Collect, Review and Produce Documents Requested
Blake M. Zollar	4/9/2014	3.8	Collect, Review and Produce Documents Requested
Blake M. Zollar	4/10/2014	1.5	Collect, Review and Produce Documents Requested
Blake M. Zollar	4/11/2014	1.7	Collect, Review and Produce Documents Requested
Blake M. Zollar	4/14/2014	2.1	Case Administration (includes co-counsel conferences not otherwise classified); Collect,
Blake M. Zollar	4/15/2014	0.8	Collect, Review and Produce Documents Requested
Blake M. Zollar	4/17/2014	1.8	Collect, Review and Produce Documents Requested
Blake M. Zollar	4/18/2014	0.9	Collect, Review and Produce Documents Requested
Blake M. Zollar	4/21/2014	0.9	Collect, Review and Produce Documents Requested
Blake M. Zollar	4/28/2014	1.2	Collect, Review and Produce Documents Requested
Blake M. Zollar	4/29/2014	0.5	Collect, Review and Produce Documents Requested
Blake M. Zollar	5/1/2014	1.1	Collect, Review and Produce Documents Requested
Total		26.2	